Legislative Regulation
.~ Review Committee

2009-003a

Department of Public Safety

STATE BUILDING CODE



k39 A REV. 1/77
STATE OF CONNECTICUT

REGULATION

of

Page 1 of 55 pages

NAME OF AGENCY
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY

Concerning
SUBJECT MATTER OF REGULATIONS

STATE BUILDING CODE-2005 CONNECTICUT
SUPPLEMENT - 2009 AMENDMENT

| DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY
IDING CODE - 2005 CONNECTICUT SUPPLEMENT

STATE BUIL
- 2009 AMENDMENT

Section 1. Secton 29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement,
lntroduct;on is cz‘mended as foIEows

Sec. 29-252—1{1 . State Building Code — 2009 Amendment to the 2005
Connecticut Supplement

L
The 2003 /inte fnaﬁonal Building Code, 2003 International Existing Building Code, 2003
International Plumbing Code, 2003 International Mechanical Code, [2003] 2006 International
Energy Consengfatlon Code and 2003 International Residential Code of the International Code

Coungil, Inc. an
Association Inci|
'by reference as the 2005 State Building Code. The requirements of the 2009
‘the 2005 State Building Code shall apply to all work for which a permit

hereby adopted
Amendment to

d the 2005 NFPA 70 National Electrical Code of the National Fire Protection
L except as amended, altered or deleted by this Connecticut Supplement, are

application was, |

Copies of the !&
4051 W. Flo
www.iccsafe.org

ssmoor

made on or after the date of adoption.

hternational Codes may be obtained from the International Code Council, Inc.,

Rd.,, Country Club Hills, IL [60478-5795] 60478 (website:

from the Natic
Quincy, MA C}
Supplement an

9).
ﬂal Fire Protection Association Inc.,

Copies of the 2005 NFPA 70 National Electrical Code may be obtained
1 Batterymarch Park, P.Q. Box 9101,
Copies of the 2005 Connecticut

12269-9101 (website: www.nfpa.org).

d the 2009 Amendment may be downloaded from {www.ct.gov/dps/dfebs/osbi]

www.ct.gov/dps.

20

09 AMENDMENT TO THE 2005 CONNECTICUT SUPPLEMENT

Add: A sectior
addition of; this

Amd: A éecti
the substitution
: é

‘l

Del: A sejctloz
deletion of thts

or subsection in the Connecticut Supplement preceded by (Add) indicates the

sect;on or subsection to the adopted referenced standard.

on or subsection in the Connecticut Supplement preceded by (Amd) indicates
of this section or subsection in the adopted referenced standard.

or subsection in the Connecticut Supplement preceded by (Del) indicates the

sectson or subsection from the adopted referenced standard.

NOTE: Be:caus,e this amendment does not repeal section 28-252-1d of the Requlations of

Connecticut State Agencies, deletions of some or all of existing sections are accomplished by

bracketing text't

o be removed. Additions to existing sections of the Connecticut Supplement

are underiined

Where new sections are being added to the Conneclicut Supplement, they are

identified as ( I\

EW) and do nof coniain bracketing or underlining.

CHAPTER 14

Sec. 2. Sect;an
Section 101.1

(Amd) 101.1
2003 lntema

AMENDMENTS TO THE 2003 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE

ADMINISTRATION

29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement, Chapter 1,

of the 2003 international Building Code, is amended as follows:

Title. Section 29-252-1d, together with the 2003 Interational Building Code,
ional Existing Building Code, 2003 International Plumbing Code, 2003

!nternataonai Mechamcai Code, [2003] 2006 International Energy Conservation Code, 2003




39A REV. /77
STATE OF CONNECTICUT

REGULATION

of

Page 2 of 55 pages

NAWME OF AGENCY
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY

Concerning
SUBJECT MATTER OF REGULATIONS

STATE BUILDING CODE-2005 CONNECTICUT
SUPPLEMENT — 2009 AMENDMENT

Intemaﬁonai;Res dential Code and the 2005 NFPA 70 National Electrical Code shall be known
as the 2005 Statef Buiiding Code, hereinafter referred to as “the code” or “this code”.

Sec. 3. Section z9-252 1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement, Chapter 1,
of the 2003 !ntematsonaﬁ Bu;[dmg Code, is amended to add:

(NEW) (Amd) 1§01.2 Scope. The provisions of this code shall apply to the construction,
alteration, movement, enlargement, replacement, repair, equipment, use and occupancy,
location, maintegfjﬂnance, removal and demolition of every building or structure or any
appurtenances connected or attached to such buildings or structures.
E.xceptidns
1. Detached one- and two-family dwellings and multiple smgle~famaly dwellings
(tow houses) not more than three stories above grade plane in height with a
separate means of egress and their accessory structures shall comply with the
2003§f‘lntemational Residential Code.
Existihg buildings undergoing repair, movement, alterations or additions and
change of occupancy shall be permitted to comply with the 2003 International
Existing Building Code. The choice to comply with this code or the 2003
Interpational Existing Building Code shall be made by the permit applicant at the
time of application for the building permit and shall be indicated on the construction
documents in writing.
(NEW) (Amd) 105.1 Required. Any owner or authorized agent who intends to construct,
enlarge, alter, reéapair, move, demolish or change the occupancy of a building or structure, or to
move a lot linethat will affect any existing building or structure, or to erect, install, enlarge,
alter, repair, remove, convert or replace any electrical, gas, mechanical or plumbing system,
f which is regulated by this code, or to cause any such work to be done, shall

the installation ¢
first make ajppiié: ation to the building official and obtain the required permit.

Sec. 4. Se_é;tion-:s 29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement, Chapter 1,

Section 105.2, :}f the 2003 Entematlonai Building Code, is amended as follows:

(Amd) 105.2 V\ﬂork exempt from permit. Exemption from the permit requirements of this

code shall not

violation of the |

{oe deemed to grant authorization for any work to be done in any manner in
provisions of this code or any other laws, statutes, regulations or ordinances of

the jurisdiction. Permits shall not be required for the following work:
Building: |
1. Fences not over & feet high.
2. Retaining walls that are not over 3 feet in height measured from finished grade at the
bottom of the wall to finished grade at the top of the wall, unless supporting a

surcharge or impounding Class |, li or lI-A liquids.

Water
galions|
S|dewa

_;'anks supported directly upon grade if the capacity does not exceed 5,000
and the ratio of height fo diameter or width does not exceed 2 to 1.
ks, driveways and on-grade concrete or masonry patios not more than 30

inches above adjacent grade and not over any basement or story below and which are

not part

- of an accessible route.

Pamtmj papering, tiling, carpeting, cabinets, countertops and similar finish work not

tnvo!v:rg structural changes or alterations.

6. Temporary motion plcture television and theater stage sets and scenery.

7. Préfabralcated swimming pools accessory to a Use Group R-3 occupancy, as
applicable in Section 101.2, which are less than 24 inches deep, do not exceed 5,000
gallon capacity and are installed entirely above ground.

8. Shade ;cloth structures constructed for nursery or agricultural purposes and not
including service systems.

9. Swings and other playground equipment,




39A REV. 477
STATE OF CONNECTICUT Page 3 of 55 pages

REGULATION

of

b
i}
H
I

NAME OF AGENCY
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY

Conceming

SUBJECT MATTER OF REGULATIONS

! STATE BUILDING CODE-2005 CONNECTICUT
| SUPPLEMENT — 2009 AMENDMENT

|

10. Window cgwnmgs supported by an exterior wall which do not project more than 54
inches from the exterior wall and do not require additional support of Group R-3, as
appkacab!e in Section 101.2 and Group U occupancies.

11. Movable cases counters and partitions not over 5 feet 9 inches in height and not
contalnmq any electrical, plumbing or mechanical equipment.

12. {Grandstands] Portable grandstands or bleachers providing seating for fewer than 100
persons when located outside of a building.

Sec. 5. Section ?9—252—10! State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement, Chapter 1,
of the 2003 Inter ational Building Code, is amended to add:

(NEW) (Add) 105.2.5 Federal agency exemptions. A federal agency performing consiruction
on federally owned land or on leased land totally under the control of the federal government
shall not be required to obtain a building permit or a demolition permit from the local building
official. i

Sec. 6. Section 29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement, Chapter 1,
Section 107.1, of the 2003 International Building Code, is amended as follows:

{(Amd) '507.;1 General. The building official is authorized fo issue a permit for temporary
structures and thmporary uses. Such permits shall be limited as to time of service, but shall
not be permitted for more than 180 days. The building official is authorized to grant a single
180-day extension for demonstrated cause.
[Excepfi ons The following shall be exempt from permit requirements:

1. Teé,nts used exclusively for recreational camping purposes.

2. Tants less than 350 square feet total area.

3. Tents 900 square feet and smaller in total area when occupied by fewer than

5@ persons, which have no heating appliances, no installed electrical service,

aﬂd are erected for fewer than 72 hours.]
Exception: Tents, canopies and other membrane structures erected for a period of
fewer thbn 180 days shall comply with Section 3103 of this code.

Sec. 7. Sectlon 29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement, Chapter 1,
of the 2003 lntema’uonai Building Code, is amended to add:

{(NEW) (Acid) 1E99 3.8.1 Electrical inspections. Required electrical inspections shall include
installations ofitemporary services prior to activation; installation of underground piping and
conductors afteg;r trenches are excavated and bedded and before backfill is put in place; rough
inspections of installed wiring and components after the roof, framing, fireblocking and bracing
are complete and prior to concealment; and final inspection after all work required by the

permit is comp!ete

f (NEW) (Add) SECTION 117 — VACANT BUILDINGS
{(NEW) (Add) 1517 1 General. Temporarily unoccupied buiidings, structures, premises or
portions theredf, including tenant spaces, shall be safeguarded and maintained in accordance
with this sectlo! .
(NEW) (Add) 117 1.1 Abandoned premises. Buildings, structures and premises for which an
owner cannot ae identified or located by dispatch of a certificate of mailing to the last known or
registered ac:lc:tE 'ess, which persistently or repeatedly become unprotected or unsecured; which
have heen occupsed by unauthorized persons or for illegal purposes; or which present a
danger of structural collapse or fire spread to adjacent properties shall be considered
abandoned, declared unsafe and abated or demolished in accordance with this code.




3% A REV. 477
STATE OF COMNECTICUT Page 4 of 55 pages

REGULATION

of

NAME OF AGENCY
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY

Concerning
SUBJECT MATIER OF REGULATIONS

STATE BUILDING CODE-2005 CONNECTICUT
SUPPLEMENT ~ 2009 AMENDMENT

(NEW) (Add) 1“7 2 Safeguarding vacant premises. Temporarily unoccupied buildings,
structures, premmes or portions thereof shall be secured and protected in accordance with this
section. %
(NEW) (Add) 11? 2.1 Security. Exterior openings and interior openings accessible to other
tenants or unauthorlzad persons shall be boarded, locked, blocked or otherwise protected to
prevent entry by pnauthorlzed individuals.

(NEW) (Add) 117.2.2 Fire protection. Fire alarm, sprinkler and standpipe systems shall be
maintained in anaoperable condition at all tfimes.

Exceptmns

1. When the premises have been cleared of all combustible materials and debris and,
in the; opinion of the code official, the type of consiruction, fire separation distance
and securtty of the premises do not create a fire hazard.

2. Where buildings will not be heated and fire protection systems will be exposed fo
freezmg temperatures fire alarm and sprinkier systems are permitted to be placed
out of service and standpipes are permitted to be maintained as dry systems
(W[thé‘é)ut an automatic water supply) provided the building has no contents or
storage and windows, doors and other openings are secured to prohibit entry by
unauthorized persons.

{(NEW) (Add) 147.2.3 Fire separation. Fire-resistance-rated partitions, fire barriers and fire
walls separating vacant tenant spaces from the remainder of the building shall be maintained.

(NEW) (Add) 1%;‘?’.3 Removal of combustibles. Persons owning, or in charge or control of, a
vacant building or portion thereof, shall remove all accumulations of combustibie materials and
flammable or combusttble waste or rubbish from such space. The premises shall be
maintained clear of waste or hazardous materials.

Exceptwns

1. Bunliangs or portions of buildings undergoing additions, alterations, repairs or

change of occupancy under a valid permit in accordance with this code.
2. Sea sonaily occupied buildings.

(NEW) (A&d) 1 174 Removal of hazardous materials. Persons owning, or in charge or
control of, a va cant building or portion thereof, shall remove all accumulations of hazardous
materials as de?ned by this code.

CHAPTER 3 - .§JSE AND OCCUPANCY CLASSIFICATION

Sec. 8. Séctio ? 29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement, Chapter 3,
of the 2003 International Building Code, is amended fo add:

(NEW) (Amd) *3041 Business Group B. Business Group B occupancy includes, among
others, the use of a building or structure, or a portion thereof, for office, professional or
service-type transactions including storage of records and accounts. Business occupancies
shall include, l:ut not be limited to, the following:

Airport _i;raffic control towers;

Animal ;hospitals, kennels and pounds;

Banks;

Barber and beauty shops;

Buildings or tenant spaces used for assembly purposes by fewer than 50 persons

when tégey are not accessory to other occupancies;

Car wgsh;

Civic ai{jministra’tion;

Clinic 'outpat:ent

Dry cleaning and laundries; pick-up and delivery stations and self-service;

Educaiional occupancies for students above the 12" grade;

.i
i

!
I



39A REV 177

Electfon

polglle
Laboratory
Motor vet

STATE OF CONNECTICUT

REGULATION

of

Page 5 of 55 pages

NAME OF AGENGCY
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY

Concerning
SUBJECT MATIER OF REGULATIONS

STATE BUILDING CODE-2005 CONNECTICUT
SUPPLEMENT — 2009 AMENDMENT

data processing;
ies; testing and research;
lcie showrooms;

Post ofﬂca,s

Print ‘shog
Professmi

is;
1al services (architects, attorneys, dentists, physicians, engineers, etc.);

Radio ancgﬂ television stations;
Teiephone exchanges;

Trammg

émd skill development not within a school or academic program.

{(NEW) (Add) §ﬂ41 1 In-home Group B occupancies. Customary in-home business
occupancies locﬁted within a single-family dwelling unit, that provide professional services and
employ a max;mum of one employee within the dwelling in addition to the residents of the
dwelling unit, shai! be classified as a Group R-3 occupancy or shall be permitted to comply
with the requ;rements of the 2003 international Residential Code portion of the 2005 State

Building Code

Sec. 9. Sectton g

i:
i
!

29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement, Chapter 3,

Section 305.2, of the 2003 international Building Code, is amended as follows:

(Amd) 305.2 Da
supervision or p:
children [older th

Sec. 10. Sectiol
of the 2003 inte

(NEW) (Add) 3¢

y care. The use of a building or structure, or portion thereof, for educational,
ersonal care services for [less] fewer than 24 hours per day for more than six
an] 3 years of age or older, shall be classified as a Group E occupancy.

n 29-252-1d, State Building Code ~ 2005 Connecticut Supplement, Chapter 3,
matlonal Building Code, is amended to add:

7 5.1 Consumer fireworks, Class 1.4G. Sparklers and fountain display items

permitted to be sold in Connecticut shall be exempt from the requirements of an H-3
occupancy undér the following circumstances:

1. The_ ’to’ca;g
maximu
2. The nev
NFPA ’i
Connecﬁ

Stores and fac
requrrements 0

amount on display and in storage in any single control area complies with the
,n allowable quantities as listed in Table 307.7(1) of this code, or;

v or existing retail store or retail sales facility complies with the provisions of
124-06 for new stores and facilities as herein amended by the State of
icut.

lities selling sparklers and fountain display items that are exempt from the
an H-3 occupancy shall provide employee supervision of the fireworks display

area; shall Eoca

te all fireworks a minimum of 5 feet from any building exit; and shall comply

with the requarements of Part IV of the Connecticut State Fire Safety Code.

(NEW) (Add) 3@7 5.2 The provisions of NFPA 1124-06 are amended for use in Connecticut as

follows:
(NEW)
regardle

Amd) 7.5.3 Storage Rooms. Storage rooms containing consumer fireworks,
ss of size, in a new or existing permanent store shall be protected with an

r:au’c_oma3 ic sprinkler system installed in accordance with NFPA 13-02, Standard for the
Installation of Sprinkler Systems, or separated from the retail sales area by a fire
barrier having a fire resistance rating of not ess than 1 hour. The quantity of fireworks
permitted in storage shall not exceed 3,600 cubic feet, including packaging. Such
storage: shall be segregated into areas of 1,200 cubic feet or less, separated by a

mir}imum of 4 feet of clear space.

on 29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement, Chapter 3,

Sec. 11. Sectié
1, 308.5.2 and 310.1, of the 2003 international Building Code, are amended as

Sections 308.5.
foliows:




39 A REV. 1177
STATE OF CONNECTICUT Page 6 of 55 pages

REGULATION

of

NAME OF AGENCY
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY

Concerning
SUBJECT MATTER OF REGULATIONS

} STATE BUILDING CODE-2005 CONNECTICUT
; SUPPLEMENT — 2002 AMENDMENT

13

H
i
1

(Amd) 308.3.1 Ci:iild care facility. A child care facility that provides care on a 24-hour basis o
more than five children less than 3 years of age [or less] shall be classified as Group |-2. Such
a facility withf five§i?or fewer children less than 3 vears of age shall be classified as Group R-3.
(Amd) 308.5.2 Oﬁuld care facility. A facility that provides supervision and personal care on
less than a 24- hc:ur»per-day basis for more than six children lgss than 3 years of age [or less]
shall be ciass;ﬂed as Group -4.
Exceptloms
1. A child dz ay care facility that provides care for more than six but no more than 100
children hass than 3 years of age [or less], when the rooms where such children are
cared forE are located on the level of exit discharge and each of these child care rooms
has an e):it door directly to the exterior, shall be classified as Group E.
2. As defined in section 19a-77 of the Connecticut Genera! Statutes, a family day care
home theﬁ accommodates six or fewer children of any age shall be classified as Group
R-3 or shall comply with the 2003 International Residential Code in accordance with
Section 101.2. During the regular school year, a maximum of three additional children
who iare ;n school fuli-time, including the provider's own children, shall be permitted,
except tt}at if the provider has more than three children who are in school full-time, all
of the provider's children shall be permitted.

(Amd) 310.1 Reg‘.idential Group R. Residential Group R includes, among others, the use of a
building or structure, or portions thereof, for sleeping purposes when not classified as an
Institutional Grolip 1. Residential occupancies shall include the following:

R-1 Residential occupancies where the occupants are primarily transient in nature (less than
30 days) including:
Boarding houses,;
Hotels; |
Motels;
Bed and breakfast establishments.

R-2 Residential; occupancies containing sleeping units or more than two dwelling units where
the occupants 'sre primarily permanent in nature, including:

Apartme nt houses;

Boardznb houses (not transient);

Convents;

Dormitdrles

Fratermiles and sororities;

Monastear;es

Hotels (not transient);

Motels (not fransient).

R-3 Res:dentfai cccupancies with independent means of egress where the occupants are
primarily permanent in nature and not classified as R-1, R-2, R-4 or | and where buildings do
not contain mogre than two dwelling units as applicabie in Section 101.2, or adult and child care
facilities that prowde accommodations for six or fewer persons of any age for less than 24
hours per day.| Adult and child care facilities that are within a single-family home are permitted
to comply with zthe 2003 International Residential Code. R-3 occupancies shall allow not more
than six lodgers or boarders where personal care services is not provided,

R-4 Residenti%\l occupancies shall include buildings arranged for occupancy as residential
care/assisted iivéng facilities including more than three but not more than 16 occupants,
excluding | staff. Group R-4 occupancies shall meet the requirements for construction as
defined for Group R-3 except as otherwise provided for in this code.

CHAPTER 4; — SPECIAL DETAILED REQUIREMENTS BASED ON USE AND




3% A REV. /77
STATE OF CONNECTICUT Page 7 of 55 pages

REGULATION

of

NAME OF AGENCY
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY

; Concerning
SUBJECT MATTER OF REGULATIONS

STATE BUILDING CODE-2005 CONNECTICUT
SUPPLEMENT — 2009 AMENDMENT

Sec. 12. Seéﬁion§29-252~1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement, Chapter 4,
of the 2003 i:nterhjationai Building Code, is amended to add:

(NEW) (Amcg) 405?2.9 Smoke control. Covered mall buildings of two or more stories shall have
a smoke control system installed in accordance with Section 909.

i
(NEW) (Amd) 404.4 Smoke control. A smoke control system shall be installed in accordance

with Section. 909§
Exceptlons Smoke conirol is not required for atriums that connect only two stories.

Sec. 13. Sectlorf 29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Suppiement, Chapter 4,
Sections 419 1. 1 and 419.1.2, of the 2003 International Building Code, are amended as

follows: : g‘

(Add) 419. 1 1 F’reschool kindergarten and first grade. Rooms normally occupied by

preschool, kmde!rgarten or first-grade students shall be located on a level of exit discharge.
Exceptmn Rooms located on levels other than a level of exit discharge shall be
permatted to be normally occupied by preschool, kindergarten or first-grade students
where SEﬁiCh rooms are provided with an independent means of egress dedicated for
use by the preschool, kindergarien or first-grade students.

(Add) 419. 1 2 Second grade. Rooms normally occupied by second-grade students shall be
located not. more than one story above a levei of exit discharge.
Exceptn@n Rooms located on levels other than one siory above a level of exit
dlscharge shall be permitted to be normally occupied by second-grade students where
such rooms are provided with an independent means of egress dedicated for use by

the second—grede students.
|

CHAPTER@S - @ENERAL BUILDING HEIGHTS AND AREAS

E&
Sec. 14, Sectmn 29-252-1d, State Bulid;ng Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement, Chapter 5,
of the 2003 Intemat;onal Building Code, is amended to add:

E

(NEW) (Add) '%0641 Mixed occupancies. In buildings of mixed occupancy, the allowable
area per story (Aa) shall be based on the most restrictive provisions for each occupancy when
the mixed occupancaes are treated according to Section 302.3.1. When the occupancies are
treated accos’digng to Section 302.3.2 as separated occupancies, the maximum total floor area
for a building gshali be such that the sum of the ratios for each such area on all floors as
calculated according to Section 302.3.2 shall not exceed 2 for two-story buildings and 3 for
buildings three }storxes or higher.

o
CHAPTER 7 - FIRE-RESISTANCE-RATED CONSTRUCTION

Sec. 15. Sectiéﬁn 29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement, Chapter 7,
Section 707.2, of the 2003 International Building Code, is amended as follows:

(Amd) 707.2 Shaft enclosure required. Openings through a fioor/ceiling assembly shall be
protected by a shaft enclosure complying with this section.
Excepiions
1. A shafi enclosure is not required for openings totally within a residential dwelling unit
and connecting three stories or less.
2. A shaft enclosure is not required in a building equipped throughout with an automatic
sprinkler system in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 for an escalator opening or a
stairway which is not a portion of the means of egress protected according to item 2.1

or;'2.2:




38 A REV. 177

9.

10.

1.

STATE OF CONNECTICUT Page 8 of 55 pages

REGULATION

i
: of
NAME OF AGENCY

DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY

Concerning
SUBJEGT MATTER OF REGULATIONS

STATE BUILDING CODE-2005 CONNECTICUT
SUPPLEMENT - 2009 AMENDMENT

;
1
i'

2.1 Whe;'a the area of the floor opening between stories does not exceed twice the

horizontal projected area of the escalator or stairway and the opening is protected by a

draft curtazn and closely spaced sprinklers in accordance with NFPA 13-02. in other

than Groups B and M, this application is limited to openings that do not connect more

than 'three stories.

2.2 \Nher@ the opening is protected by approved power-operated horizontal automatic

shutters ;a’t every floor penefrated. The shuiters shall be of noncombustible

construction and have a fire-resistance rating of not less than 1.5 hours. The shutter

shall be 5o constructed as to close immediately upon actuation of a smoke detector

installed m accordance with Section 207.10 and shall completely shut off the well

opening.. Escalators shall cease operation when the shutter begins to close. The

shutter shaEi operate at a speed of not more than 30 feet per minute and shall be

equspped with a sensitive leading edge to arrest its progress where in contact with any

obstacle, and to continue its progress on release there from.

A shaft e*nciosure is not required for penetrations by pipe, tube, conduit, wire, cable

and vent%‘ protected in accordance with Section 712.4.

A shaft encfosure is not required for penetrations by ducts protected in accordance

with Section 712.4. Grease ducts shall be protected in accordance with the 2003

International Mechanical Code.

A shaft énclosure is not required for floor openings complying with the provisions for

covered malls or atriums.

A shaft enclosure is not required for approved masonry chimneys, where annular

space protection is provided at each fioor level in accordance with Section 717.2.5.

In other than Groups |-2 and -3, a shaft enclosure is not required for a floor opening

that! comphes with the following:

7.1. Does not connect more than two stories.

.2. s not part of the required means of egress system except as permitted in
Section 1019.1.

3. Is not concealed within the building construction.

4. Is not open to a corridor in Group | and R occupancies.

.5. Is not open to a corridor in buildings not equipped throughout with an

automatic sprinkier system in accordance with Section 903.3.1 in any

occupancy.

.6. Is separated from floor openings serving other floors by construction

i conforming to [Section 706] required shaft enclosures.

A shaft ‘enclosure is not required for automobile ramps in open parking garages and

enclosed parking garages constructed in accordance with Sections 406.3 and 406.4,

respect Veiy

A shaft ?nc]osure is not required for floor openings between a mezzanine and the floor

pelow.

A shaft enclosure is not required for joints protected by a fire-resistant joint system in

accordance with Section 713.

Where permitted by other sections of this code.

oo |

s T B I

CHAPTER 9 -fgiFlRE PROTECTION SYSTEMS

Sec. 16. Sect:@n 29-252-1d, State Bualdmg Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement, Chapter 9,
of the 2003 !nternational Building Code, is amended {o add:

E

(NEW) (Amd) 903.2.1.2 Group A-2. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided for
Group A-2 occupancses where one of the following conditions exists:

1.

The ﬁré\ area exceeds 5,000 square feet.

Excepg,lon Existing restaurants in existing non-sprinklered buildings that were
designated Use Group A-3 under a previous edition of the State Building Code that
undergo addition, alteration or change of occupancy that results in an increase in the
restaugfant’s fire area providing the proposed fire area does not exceed 12,000 square
feet. |

!

I
|
E



39A REV 177

STATE OF CONNECTICUT Page 9 of 55 pages

REGULATION

of

é NAWME OF AGENCY

DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY

Concerning
SUBJECT MATTER OF REGULATIONS

STATE BUILDING CODE-2005 CONNECTICUT
SUPPLEMENT -~ 2009 AMENDMENT

i

2. The fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more.
3. The fire ajea is located on a floor other than the level of exit discharge.

Sec. 17. SeCtion§29~252-’Eé, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement, Chapter 9,
Sections 903.2. 7??. of the 2003 International Building Code, is amended as follows:

(Amd) 803.2.7 Group R. An automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with
Section 903.3 shall be provided throughout all newly constructed buildings with a
Group R fire grea or_in_existing buildings that have a Group R fire area newly
introduced by change of occupancy or by an addition,

Exceptions:
1. Group!R-1 bed and breakfast establishments,

2. Exzstmg buildings four stories or less in height undergoing a change of occupancy
from a_one- or two-family building or Group R-3 to Group R-2 containing not more than
four dweEhnq units that does nof involve an increase in height or area and where each
dwelhng unit has either:
: 2§ 1 An exit door directly to the exterior at a level of exit discharge,
22,2 Direct access to an exterior stair serving a maximum of two dwelling units
on the same story, or
213 Direct access fo an interior stair serving only that dwelling unit and
sé%aparated from all other portions of the building with 1-hour fire-resistance-
rated fire barriers.
3. Existing buildings converted prior to June 15,1994 from a one- or two-family
building or Group R-3 to Group R-2 containing not more than four dwelling units.
4. Horizontal additions containing a newly_introduced Group R occupancy that are
added to existing buildings shall be required to have an automatic sprinkler system
installediin the addition only if the addition is completely separated from {he existing
building by fire barriers with a minimum one-hour fire-resistance rating.

Sec. 18. Sectiogn 29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement, Chapter 9,
of the 2003 §ntematﬁonal Building Code, is amended to add:

(NEW) (Add) |

203.2.7.1 Small residential carelassisted living facility alternative

compliance. Ag NFPA 13D automatic sprinkler system in accordance with Section 903.3.1.3
shall be pe:rmitt:fed in a Group R-4 occupancy when all of the following conditions are met:

1. The facility is not in a bu;ldmg containing mixed occupancies,

2. Thefac hty is limited to six or fewer occupants, excluding staff,

3. The bui ding in which the facility is located is limited to two stories above grade and 40

feet in

jeight,

4. The au’gbmatlc sprinkier system is provided with a minimum 30-minute water supply,

5. All habifable and usable areas and closets are sprinklered, and

8. The Sprankker system is provided with valve supervision by one of the following
methods:

I

61 A single listed control vaive that shuts off both domestic and sprinkler
s_system water supply and a separate valve that shuts off the domestic system

f@n Iy.

6.2. Electrical supervision connected to the facility’s fire alarm system.
6.3. Valve closure that causes the sounding of an audible aiarm audible

throughout the premises.

(NEW) (Add) 9

03.3.1.1.2 Vertical openings. Closely spaced sprinklers and draft stops are not

required arourgid floor openings permitted to be unenclosed by this code unless the closely

spaced sprink
Exception 2.1

ers and draft stops are being utilized in lieu of an enclosure as specified by
o Section 707.2.




39 A REV. 177
STATE OF CONNECTICUT

REGULATION

of

Page 10 of 55 pages

NAME OF AGENCY
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY

i
£
;
i
!
'

% Concerning

SUBJECT MATTER OF REGULATIONS

STATE BUILDING CODE-2005 CONNECTICUT
SUPPLEMENT - 2009 AMENDMENT

(NEW) (Amd) 9{}3 3.1.2 NFPA 13R sprinkler systems. Where allowed in buildings of Group
R, up to and mciudmg four stories above grade and 60 feet in height, automatic sprinkler
systems sha!l beimsta!led throughout in accordance with NFPA 13R.

(NEW) (Add) 90’5‘3 3.1.2.2 Mixed occupancies. Buildings containing occupancies other than
Group R shall nogt be permitted to utilize an NFPA 13R sprinkler system.
Exceptson Buildings that comply with Section 508.2 that contain only Group R
occupanczes above the horizontal assembly shall be permitted to utilize an NFPA 13R
sprlnkier system above the horizontal assembly provided such occupancy complies
with Sectzon 903.3.1.2.

Sec. 19. Section 29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement, Chapter 9,

Section 903.3.5. 1 1, of the 2003 International Building Code, is amended as follows:
i

(Amd) 903.3.5. 131 Limited area sprinkler systems. Limited area sprinkler systems serving

six sprinklers oq less in any fire area are permitted to be connected to the domestic service
where a wet aufomatic standpipe is not available. Limited area sprinkler systems connected
to domestic: wateiar supplies shall comply with each of the following requirements;
1. Valves shall not be installed between the domestic water riser control valve and the
spr:nklers
Exceptlon to Item 1: An approved indicating control valve supervised
qkectrscal!y or locked or secured in the open position shall be permitted.
2. The domestic service shall be designed and installed in accordance with NFPA 13-02 or

NFF’A 13D 02.
i

Sec. 20, Sect:on 29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement, Chapter 9,
of the 2003 !ntemattonai Building Code, is amended fo add:

(NEW) (Amd) 4@3 3.5.2 Secondary water supply. A secondary on-site water supply equal to

the hydraulically calculated sprinkler demand, including the hose stream requirement, shall be

provided for htgh rise buildings in Seismic Design Category D, E or F as determined by this

code. The secondary water supply shall have a duration of not less than 30 minutes.
Excepttﬁon: Existing buildings.

(NEW) (Add) 905 2.1 Piping design. The riser piping, supply piping and the water service
piping shall be!s:zed fo maintain a residual pressure of at least 100 pounds per square inch
(psi) at the topmost outlet of each riser while flowing the minimum quantities of water specified
based upon a pressure of 150 psi available at the fire department connection.
Exception In buildings equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system in
accordcmce with Section 903.3.1.1 or Section 803.3.1.2 and where the highest floor
level 13 not more than 150 feet above the lowest level of fire department vehicle

access:

(NEW) (Amd)
equipped with
heliport is loca
2.5-inch outlet

Sec. 21. _Sect
Sections 906.1

Class | standpipes shall have an automatic or manual-wet supply.
;55905.3.6 Helistops and heliports. Buildings with a helistop or heliport that are
a standpipe shall extend the standpipe to the roof level on which the helistop or
fed. All portions of the helistop and heliport area shall be within 150 feet of a
ona Class | or Class ili standpipe.

on 29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement, Chapter 9,
.1, 906.1.2 and 907.9.3.1, of the 2003 International Building Code, are

amended as fcgilows

(Add) 906.1.1

Group R-1 bed and breakfast establishments. In Group R-1 bed and

breakfast establishments, portable fire extinguishers shall be required to be located in

Kitchens.; Alll
accordance w
approved com

i
13

portable fire extinguishers shall be selected, installed and maintained in
ith NFPA 10-[00J02. A listed residential range top extinguisher unit or an
mercial kitchen hood with a listed, approved automatic fire suppression system




39A REV. 177 ;

STATE OF CONNECTICUT

REGULATION

of

E NAME OF AGENCY
; DEPARTME

NT OF PUBLIC SAFETY

Concerning

SUPPLEMEN

1 SUBJECT MATTER OF REGULATIONS

| STATE BUILDING CODE-2005 CONNECTICUT

T — 2009 AMENDMENT

shall be perrﬁitted to be installed in lieu of {

Kitchen.
s

(Add) 906.1. 2 Group F occupancies. Pof
and mamtaaned !n Group F occupancies in 3
E

(Add) 907. 931 Alarm transmission. \1’3

system shall be arranged to automatically
via any of the foigowmg means in accordan
1. Auxiliary alarm system;
2. Central s*faﬂon connection;
3. Propﬂetaéy system; or
4. Remote cstatlon connection.

%
Sec. 22. Section 29-252- 1d, State Building

e with NFPA 72-[03]02:

of the 2003 Intergnatlonal Building Code, is amended to add:

(NEW) (Amd) 90@9 16 Fire-fighter's smok

Page 11 of 55 pages

he installation of a portable fire extinguisher in the
table fire extinguishers shall be selected, installed
ccordance with NFPA 10-[00]02.

here required by Section 907.9.3, the fire alarm
ransmit the alarm to the municipal fire department

Code ~ 2005 Connecticut Supplement, Chapter 9,

control panel. A fire-fighter's smoke control panel

to be used soié&y for fire department emergency response purposes shall be provided and
shall include manual control or override ¢f automatic control for mechanical smoke control
systems. The panei shall be located in a fire command center complying with Section 911 in
the fire-fighter's smoke control panel shall be

installed in an approved location adjace t to the fire alarm control panel. The fire-fighter's

high-rise bwldmgs In all other buildings,

smoke controi panei shall comply with Sections 909.16.1 to 909.16.3, inclusive.

(NEW) (Amd) 9101 General. Where required by this code or otherwise installed, smoke and
heat vents or mechamcai smoke exhaust systems and draft curtains shall conform to the

reguirements of ithis section.
Exceptmns

1. Frozén food warehouses used splely for storage of Class | and li commodities where
protecteg:l by an approved automatic sprinkler system.
2. Wherg areas of buildings are equipped with early suppression fast-response (ESFR)
spnnkter‘s automatic smoke and heat vents shall not be required within these areas.

CHAPTER 10 .- MEANS OF EGRESS

Sec. 23. Sectiofn 29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement, Chapter
10, of the 2003 International Building Code, is amended to add:

(NEW) (Amd) *
less than 7 feet 6 inches.
Exceptﬁons

1. Sloped ceilings in accordance with Section 1208.2.
. Cemngs of dwelling units and sleeping units within residential occupancies in

accbrdance with Section 1208,2.

2
3. A!quvable projections in accordance with Section 1003.3.
4, Stagir headroom in accordance with Section 1008.2.

5. Door height in accordance with Section 1008.1.1.

003.2 Ceiling height. The means of egress shall have a ceiling height of not

(NEW) (Amd)

pylon shall noe

leading edge is more than 27 inches Td less than 80 inches above the walking surface.

Where a sign
between the
obstruction st
ground.

1003 3.2 Free-standing o

bjects. A free-standing object mounted on a post or
on more than 4 inches where the lowest point of the

overhang that post or pyl

or other obstruction is mo
posts or pylons is greate

nted between posts or pylons and the clear distance
than 12 inches, the lowest edge of such sign or

\ail be 27 inches maximum or 80 inches minimum above the finish floor or




39 A REV. /77
STATE QF CONNECTICUT

REGULATION
of

Page 12 of 55 pages

NAME OF AGENCY
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY

concerning
GULATIONS

CODE-2005 CONNECTICUT
I — 2009 AMENDMENT

SUBJECT MATTER QF RE

STATE BUILDING
SUPPLEMEN]

{
{
¥
i

Exceptictﬂ%: This requirement shall
stairs and gramps.

hot apply to sloping portions of handrails serving

{
(NEW) (Add) 1003.8 Security device. Any
that couid obsc,;’zre a means of egress
prohibited. |
f
{NEW) (Add) 10@3 9 Mirrors. Mirrors shall not be placed on exit doors. Mirrors shall not be
placed in or adjaic,ent to any exit in such a manner as to confuse the direction of egress travel.
(NEW) (Amd) 1@104 1.2 Number by Table 1004.1.2. The number of occupants computed at a
rate of one occupant per unit of area as prescribed in Table 1004.1.2.
Exceptlon Day care occupancies shall be calculated at a rate of one occupant per 35

square feet of net area.

security device or system that emits any medium
in any building, structure or premises shall be

(NEW) (Amd) 1&5}5.1 Minimum required eégress width. The means of egress width shall not
be less than req{lired by this section. The total width of means of egress in inches shall not be
less than the to a! occupant load served by the means of egress multiplied by the factors in
Table 1005.1 a'ld not less than specified elsewhere in this code. The maximum capacity
required from any story of a building shalf be maintained to the termination of the means of
egress. x

Exceptu:gn: Means of egress complying with Section 1024.

Sec. 24. Sectioét 29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement, Chapter

10, Section 100?.1.1, of the 2003 international Building Code, is amended as follows:

z
(Del) 1005.1.1 E%akanced eqress capacity, Delete section in its entirety and replace with:

(Add) 1005.1 ‘l Multiple means of gress Muitiple means of egress in buildings
requiring more than one exit and in rooms or spaces requiring more than one means
of egress shall be sized so that the logs of any one means of egress shall not reduce
the required capacity of the remaining means of egress to a fraction less than that
determined as follows:

R-1
R

=C

where:

R_= the number of required means of egress from a room, space or story as
determined by Section 1014 or Section 1018

C = the minimum fraction of required egress capacity remaining after the loss of any

one means oi eyress

Sec. 25. Sectlon 29-252-1d, State Bus!thg Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement, Chapter

10, of the 2003
|

(NEW) (Add) 1
shall be arrar
interruption of

international Building Code, is amended to add:

006.3.1 When required. The emergency means of egress illumination system
ged fo provide the required illumination automatically in the event of any

normal lighting due to any bf the following:

1. Failure
2. Openm

g of a circuit breaker or fui

of a public utility or other outside electrical power supply.

3. Manuai acts including accidental opening of a switch controlling normal lighting
facslmes

|
(NEW) (Amd)

1009.11.2 Intermediate handrails. Intermediate handrails are required for

stairs with a %'equired width exceeding (75 inches so that all portions of the stairway width




38 A REV. 177

STATE OF CONNECTICUT

REGULATION

of

Page 13 of 55 pages

NAME OF AGENCY

DEPARTMEIlLT OF PUBLIC SAFETY

Eoncem%ng
SUBJECT MATTER OF REGULATIONS

STATE BUILDING CODE-2005 CONNECTICUT
SUPPLEMENT 2009 AMENDMENT

1
i
]
i
H

[
i
\

required foriegréss capacity are within 30 inches of a handrail. On monumental stairs,

handrails shall bej

Sec. 26. Se{:tion

10, Section 1010;

located along the most dzrect path of egress travel.

129-252-1d, State Building | Code 2005 Connecticut Supplement, Chapter
7.1, of the 2003 intematlonal Building Code, is amended as follows:

(Amd) 1010.7.1 Ramp surface. The surface of ramps shall be of slip-resistant materials that

are securely atte
Section 302.3 of

ched|, solid] and [without perforatlons] in_compliance with the provisions of
the ICC/ANSI A117.1-2003 standard.

Sec. 27. Section

29-252-1d, State Building: Code 2005 Connecticut Supplement, Chapter

10, of the 2003 llltematlonai Building Code is amended to add:

[

3

(NEW) (Del) 1070.9 Edge protection. Deiete section and subsections in their entirety and

substitute with:

(NEW) (Add) 1010.9 Edge protection. Edge protection for ramps shall be in accordance with
Section 405.9 oﬁ;the ICC/ANSI A117.1-2003 standard.

29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement, Chapter
1.1, of the 2003 International Building Code, is amended as follows:

Sec. 28. Sectlor
10, Section 101?

(Add) 1011 1 1 %}-Ioor proximity exit signs. [In addition to the] Where exit signs are required
by [Sections] Section 1011.1 [and 1011.1.2] of this code, exit access doors and exit doors
shall a ddltlonaE!\f; be marked by floor proximity exit signs in Group A occupancies with an
occupant load of more than 300, Group B medical occupancies, Group I-1 occupancies,
Group -2 occupjancies, Group R-1 hotels and motels and Group R-2 dormitories.

Sec. 29. Section 29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement, Chapter
10, of the 2003 ?ntemational Building Code, is amended to add:

f
l11 1.1.2 Approval, Floor proximity exit signs shall be listed and labeled in
h UL 924, Emergency Lighting and Power Equipment, Edition 9, dated
06

(NEW) (Add) 1
accordance wi
February 24, 2C

Sec. 30. Sec’uon 29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement, Chapter
10, Section 1011 1.2, of the 2003 International Building Code, is amended as follows:

(Add) 1011.1. ? Accessibie exits. [In addition to the] Where exit signs are required by
[Sections] Section Section 1011.1 [and 1011.1.1] of this code, accessible [exits] exit doors at the level
of exit dlscharge that lead directly to accessible paths of exit discharge shall additionally be
marked by the International Symbol of Accessibility. Such symbo! shall be not less than 6
inches high and shall be incorporated into the required exit sign or shall be located directly
adjacent to it. Such symbol shall meet the requirements of Section 1011.

i
Sec. 31. Section 29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement, Chapter
10, of the @2003*lntemationaf Building Code, is amended to add:

(NEW) (Amd) 1012 2 Height. Guards shall form a protective barrier not less than 42 inches
high, measureeﬁ verticaily above the leading edge of the tread or the adjacent walking surface.

Excep ions:
1. For occupancies in Group R-1 bed and breakfast establishments and in Group R-3,
s anci within individual dwelling units in occupancies in Group R-2, guards whose top

: ra;l;}also serves as a handrail shall have a height not less than 34 inches and not
@ mogre than 38 inches measured vertically from the leading edge of the stair tread
- nosing.

|

i
i
i
!
i
i
i



39 A REV. 1/77
STATE OF CONNECTICUT Page 14 of 55 pages

REGULATION

of

NAME OF AGENCY
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY

Concerning
SUBJECT MATTER OF REGULATIONS

STATE BUILDING CODE-2005 CONNECTICUT
SUPPLEMENT - 2009 AMENDMENT

i
.l

2. For oc cupanmes in Group R-1 bed and breakfast establishments, level guards shall
be not less than 36 inches high, measured vertically above the adjacent walking
surface.

3. The h.?lght in assembly seating areas shall be in accordance with Section 1024.14.

(NEW) (Amd) 1012.3 Opening limitations. Open guards shall have balusters or ornamental
patterns such that a 4-inch diameter sphere cannot pass through any opening up to a height of
34 inches. Fjrom“a height of 34 inches o 42 inches above the adjacent walking surfaces, a
sphere 8 inches in diameter shall not pass.

EXCEPEO?’IS'

1. The trianguiar openings formed by the riser, tread and bottom rail at the open side
of a stalrway shall be of a maximum size such that a sphere 8 inches in diameter
cann(:t pass through the opening.

2. At eieﬁvated walking surfaces for access to and use of electrical, mechanical or
plumbmg systems or equipment, guards shall have horizontal rails, balusters or be
of solid material such that a sphere with a diameter of 21 inches cannot pass
throu@h any opening.

3. In ar@*as that are not open to the public, within occupancies in Group I-3, F, Hor S,
baiusters horizontal intermediate rails or other construction shall not permit a
sphere with a diameter of 21 inches to pass through any opening.

4. In as:aembly seating areas, guards at the end or aisles where they terminate at a
fascu? of boxes, balconies and galleries shall have balusters or ornamental patterns
such that a 4-inch- diameter sphere cannot pass through any opening up to a height
of 26€ inches. From a height of 26 inches to 42 inches above the adjacent walking
surfaces a sphere 8 inches in diameter shall not pass.

5 In G&oup R-1 bed and breakfast establishments, guards shall have balusters or
ornamentai patterns such that a 6-inch-diameter sphere cannot pass through any

opeqmg

(NEW) (Amd) 1"013 2 Egress through adjoining spaces. Egress from a room or space shall
not pass through adjoining or intervening rooms or areas, except where such adjoining rooms
or areas are accessory to the area served; are not a high-hazard occupancy and provide a
discernable path of egress travel to an exit. Egress shall not pass through kitchens, storage
rooms, closets jor spaces used for similar purposes. An exit access shall not pass through a
room that can EEae locked to prevent egress. Means of egress from dwelling units or sleeping
areas shall not fead through other dwelling units, sleeping areas, toilet rooms or bathrooms.

Exceptsons

1. Meaéps of egress are not prohibited through a kitchen area serving adjoining rooms
congtituting part of the same dwelling unit or sleeping unit.

2. QMeans of egress are not prohibited through adjoining or intervening rooms or
:spaces in a Group H occupancy when the adjoining or intervening rooms or spaces
are of the same or a lesser hazard occupancy group.

3. 3Noti more than 50 percent of the required exit access may travel through
stockrooms in Group M occupancxes when the stock is of the same hazard
:clasgsmcatlon as that found in the main retail area; when the stockroom is not
‘subject to locking from the egress side; and when there is a 44-inch wide aisle
‘defined by full or partial height fixed walls or similar fixed construction that will
_ mamtam the required width and lead directly from the retail area to the exit without
: obsiruct:ons

(NEW) (Add) ‘5023 2.1 Remoteness. Where two or more doors leading to exit discharge are
required, a mtplmum of two such doors shall be placed a distance apart equal {o not less than
one-third of the length of the maximum overall diagonal dimension of the building served,
measured in g straight line between doors. Additional doors leading fo exit discharge shall be
arranged ‘a reasonable distance apart so that if one becomes blocked, the others will be
available.. |




39A REV.1TT7
STATE OF CONNECTICUT Page 15 of 55 pages

REGULATION

of

i NAME OF AGENCY
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY

1

i Concerning
% SUBJECT MATTER OF REGULATIONS
|

STATE BUILDING CODE-2005 CONNECTICUT
SUPPLEMENT - 2009 AMENDMENT

1
!
!
i
t

3
:i’

Sec. 32. Section 29-252—101 State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement, Chapter
10, Section 1024 2 of the 2003 International Building Code, is amended as follows:
(Amd) 1024, 2 Assembty main exit. [Group A occupancies that have an occupant load of
greater than 300, shail be provided with a main entrance that is also the main exit.] In [other]
Group A occupanc:ias that are newly constructed, have an increase in the number of
occupants by addition or alteration or are created by change of gccupancy and that have a
single main entrr—.;nce such main entrance shall also be the main exit. The main entrance/exit
shall be of sufficient width to accommodate not less than two-thirds of the occupant load, but
such width shall not be less than the total required width of all means of egress leading to the
exit. [Where the building is classified as a Group A occupancy, the main exit shall front on at
least one st_reethor on an unoccupied space of not less than 10 feet in width that adjoins a
street or public vgfay
Exceptiqfn: In assembly occupancies where there is no well-defined main entrance
and mair] exit or where multiple main entrances and main exits are provided, exits shall
be permited to be distributed around the perimeter of the building or space containing
the assembly occupancy, provided that the total width of egress is not less than 100
per cent Es’::»f the required width.]

Sec. 33. Sect;on 29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement, Chapter
10, of the 2003 Enternatlonat Building Code, is amended to add:

I
(NEW) (Amd) 1@25 3 Maximum height from floor. Emergency escape and rescue openings
shall have the bettom of the clear opening not greater than 44 inches measured from the floor.
Exceptmn The 44-inch maximum height shall be permitted to be measured vertically
above afixed, permanent platform, step or steps whose minimum width shall equal or
exceed Lhe operable width of the opening and shall be centered on such opening and
wh;ch shaﬂ comply with Section 1009.3.

(NEW) (Ad_d) S ;CT!ON 1026 FLOOR PROXIMITY EGRESS PATH MARKING

(NEW) (Add) 1 326 1 Where required. In addition to means of egress illumination required by

Section 1006, fioor proximity egress path marking systems or devices shall be required in exit

access corﬂdors serving an occupant load greater than 30 in the following newly constructed

occupancies: ;a

Group A occupancies with a total occupant load greater than 300.

Group E% medical occupancies.

Group g" occupancies.

Group I-1 occupancies.

Group f~2 occupancies.

Group R~1 hotels and motels.

Group | R—Z dormitories.

Exceptsons

. Group E occupancies where each classroom has at least one door directly to the
; extéﬂor and rooms for assembly purposes have at least one-half of the required
megans of egress doors opening directly to the exterior. Exterior doors specified in

. this exception are required to be at ground level.

2. In corrsdors or hallways located within Group R-1 and R-2 sleeping units or
g dwc?ilmg units.

3. Sugc___:h systems shall not be required in existing buildings of any occupancy including
thoée undergoing repair, addition, alteration or change of occupancy.

NOE R WON -

(NEW) (Add) d026 2 Size and location. Where required by Section 1026.1, floor proximity
egress path nt arkmg systems or devices shall be located on the walls of exit access corridors
within 18 inches of the finished floor to provide a visible delineation of the path of travel along
the exit acces% corridor. Such markings or devices shall be essentially continuous, except as
snterrupted b doorways, intersecting hallways and corridors or other similar architectural




39 A REV. /77
STATE OF CONNECTICUT

REGULATION

of

Page 16 of 55 pages

NAME OF AGENCY
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY

Concerning
SUBJECT MATTER OF REGULATIONS

STATE BUILDING CODE-2005 CONNECTICUT
SUPPLEMENT — 2009 AMENDMENT

features. there such systems or devices are phofoluminescent, they shail be a minimum of 1
inch and a maximum of 2 inches in width.

26.3 Device or system requirements. Floor proximity egress path marking
ces shall be listed and labeled and installed in accordance with the
installation requirements. Such systems shall not incorporate arrows,
chevrons, signs ior alternating lighting patterns designed or intended to lead an occupant to
any one specn‘tc exat in preference over another exit.
Exception Systems incorporating arrows, chevrons, signs or alternating lighting
patterns deagned or intended to lead an occupant in any one specific direction shall
be perm;ﬁed in dead end corridors.

(NEW) (Add) 10
systems or dev
manufacturer's

(NEW) (Add) 105?6 4 Materials. Fioor proximity egress path marking systems or devices shall
be permitted to be made of any material, including paint. Such materials shall include, but not
be limited fo: self—lummous materials; photoluminescent materials; and electrical photo
luminescent mater:als Materials shall comply with either:

1. UL 1;994 Standard for Luminous Egress Path Marking Systems, Edition 3, dated
January 30, 2004, or
2. ASTM E 2072, except that the charging source shall be 1 fc (10 iux) of fluorescent

|Eiummatlon for 60 minutes, and the minimum luminance shall be 5 millicandelas
per square meter after 90 minutes.
I
(NEW) (Add) 1(326 § HHumination. Floor proximity egress path marking sysiems or devices
shall be contmuously illuminated or shall illuminate within 10 seconds in the event of power
failure. llEummatlon shall be maintained for a period of not less than 90 minutes following loss
of power to. the corridor within which the system or device is located.

Corridors  where

(NEW) (A_dd)
photoluminesce
provided with thi

i
i

60 minutes;prlo

CHAPTER 11

Sec. 34. S:BC'CI

11, of the 2003

(NEW) (Amd)

!1026 5.4 Photoluminescent systems or devices.
pt floor proximity exit path marking systems or devices are installed shall be
e minimum means of egress illumination required by Section 1006 for at least
fo periods when the building is occupied.

/ACCESSIBILITY

|
n 29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement, Chapter
internatsonal Building Code, is amended to add:

C

‘ﬁ104 4 Multilevel buildings and facilities. At least one accessible route shall

connect each éccessable tevel, including mezzanines, in multi-level buildings and facilities.
Exceptnons

1. ‘An

%accesszbie route is not required {o stories and mezzanines that comply with

Seclions 1103.2.15 and 1103.2.16, respectively.

2.

In Group A, 1, R and S occupancies, levels that do notf contain accessible elements

or oiher spaces required by Section 1107 or 1108 are not required to be served by
an access;b!e route from an accessible level.

‘the
‘Wh

fewe

req

(NEW) (Amd)

In a:r traffic control towers, an accessible route is not required fo serve the cab and

_loor immediately below the cab.

are a two-story building or facility has one story with an occupant load of five or
er persons that does not contain public use space, that story shall not be
Uired to be connected by an accessible route to the story above or below.

§106.5 Van spaces. For every six or fraction of six accessible parking spaces,

at least one shall be a van-accessible parking space. Each public parking garage or terminal

shall have a mi

(NEW) (Amd)
accessible bul

£
[
i
i
H

i
o
i

nimum of two van-accessible parking spaces complying with this section.

1107.4 Accessible route. At least one accessible route shall connect
ding or facility entrances with the primary entrance of each accessible unit,

i
i




33 A REV. 177

Type A unit and
facilities that sen
Exception:
buildings

STATE OF CONNECTICUT

REGULATION

of

NAME OF AGENCY
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY

Concerning

SUBJECT MATTER OF REGULATIONS

STATE BUILDING CODE-2005 CONNECTICUT
SUPPLEMENT — 2009 AMENDMENT

Type B unit within the building or facility and with those exterior and interior
‘e the units.

If the slope of the finished ground level between accessible facilities and
iexceeds one unit vertical in 12 units horizontal (1:12), or where physical

barriers prevent the installation of an accessible route, a vehicular route with parking

that com
permltted

Sec. 35. Sectlor
11, Sections 110
Building Code, 2

(Amd) 1107.6.2
dwelling units or

1.1 Type A units.

lies with Section 1106 at each public or common use facility or building is
/in place of the accessible route,

29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement, Chapter
7.6.2.1.1, 1107.6.3.1, 1107.7.2 and 1109.2.2.1, of the 2003 International
re amended as follows:

In occupancies in Group R-2 containing more than 20
sleeping units, at least 10 per cent|, but not less than one,] of the units shall

be a Type A unl
the building or w
and the requsrec'

in accordance with ICC/ANS! A117.1-2003. All R-2 units on the site, within
ithin the complex, shall be considered to determine the total number of units
number of Type A units. Type A units shall be dispersed among the various

Page 17 of 55 pages

classes of units.!
Exceptu?nS'

1. The i’gumber of Type A units is permitted to be reduced in accordance with Section

1107,

7.5,
2. Existing Group R-2 buildings or structures on a site or within a complex shall not
cont :jbute o the total number of units on a site,

: i
(Del} 1107. 6 3. ‘%’3 Townhouses. Delete section in its entirety without substitution,

(Del} 1107, 7 2 Iﬁ.'!ultlstory units. Delete section and subsections in their entirety and replace
with:

E%

(Add) 1107.7. Zi{Multsstory units. A_multistory dwelling or_sleeping unit that is not provided
with elevator service is not reguired fo be a Type B unit. Where a multistory unit is provided
with external elevator service to only one floor, the floor provided with elevator service shall be
the primary enirance to the unit and shall comply with the requirements for a Type B unit,
providing provisions for living, sleeping, eating, cooking and a complete toilet and bathing
facility on that floor. Where a multistory unit is provided with external elevator service to more
than one floor of the unit, one floor shall be the primary entrance to the unit and shall comply
with _the reguitements for a Type B unit, providing provisions for living, sleeping, eating,
cooking and a ,;omgiete toilet and bathing facility on that floor.

(Amd) 1109.2. 2 1 Pull handle. Where accessible water closet compariments or single
occupancy t01ie=t rooms are provided, the compariment or room doors shall have a pull handle
mounted 6 ;ncpes from the hinge side on the compartment or room side of the door. This
handle shall be between 26 inches and 36 inches from the floor and shall meet the
requirements of Section 404.2.{716 of ICC/ANSI A117.1-2003,
Exceptﬁon Compartments or rooms with self-closing, self-latching doors.
Sec. 36, Secti;%ign 29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Suppiement, Chapter
11, of the 200"4“ international Building Code, is amended to add:
%
(NEW) (Amd) 1109.13 Controls, operating mechanisms and hardware. Controls,
operating mechanisms and hardware intended for operation by the occupant, including
switches that controf lighting and ventilation, and electrical convenience outlets, in accessible
spaces, along|: accessible routes or as parts of accessible elements shall be accessible.
Excep‘uons
Op&arabie parts that are intended for use only by service or maintenance personnel
sh’al! not be required to be accessible.

i
i
i
i

;




3¢ A REV. 177
STATE OF CONNECTICUT

REGULATION
of

Page 18 of 55 pages

NAME OF AGENCY
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY

Concerning
SUBJECT MATIER OF REGULATIONS

STATE BUILDING CODE-2005 CONNECTICUT
SUPPLEMENT — 2009 AMENDMENT

i
I

2. Eiectr cal or communication receptacles serving a dedicated use shall not be
requtred to be accessible.

3. Wheren two or more outlets are provided in a kitchen above a length of countertop
that zs recuired to be accessible that is uninterrupted by a sink or appliance, one
outlet! 'shall not be required to be accessible.

4, Fioorie!ectﬂcal receptacles shall not be required to be accessible.

5. HVAG diffusers shall not be required to be accessible.

G. Except for light switches, where redundant controls are provided for a single
element one control in each space shall not be required to be accessible.

7. Access doors or gates in barrier walls and fences protecting pools, spas and hot

tubs shall be permitted to have operable parts of the release of latch on self-
latchi%g devices at 54 inches maximum and 48 inches minimum above the finished
floor or ground, providing the self-latching devices are not also self-locking devices,
oper'ﬁted by means of a key, electronic opener or integral combination lock.

z

(NEW) (Del) 11( 9 15 Stairways. Delete section in its entirety without substitution.

CHAPTER 16 - STRUCTURAL DESIGN

Sec. 37. Sectfo ;z 29-252-1d, State Building Code -~ 2005 Connecticut Supplement, Chapter
18, of the 2003 Enternational Building Code, is amended to add:

309.2 Definitions., Amend the following definition;
DEBRIS REGION. Areas where the basic wind speed in accordance with
20 mph.

CHAPTER A7 -

(NEW) (Amid) 1
WIND-BORNE
Appendix K is 1
STRUCTURAL TESTS AND SPECIAL INSPECTIONS
Sec. 38. Section 29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement, Chapter
17, Section 1704.2.2, of the 2003 International Buiiding Code, is amended as foliows:
o
Fabricator approval. Special inspections required by Section 1704.2.1 are
ere the work is done on the premises of [a fabricator of structural steel that has
been certified i:y AISC Fabricator Certification Program or a fabricator of precast concrete that
has been Certefé ted by PCI Plant Certification Program.] the following certified fabricators:
1. A fabricator of structural steel that is certified by the American Institute of Steel
Constru.pt;on Inc.’s Fabricator Certification Program.
2. A fabricator of precast concrete that is certified by the Precast/Prestressed Concrete
Institute’s Plant Certification Program.
A fabricator of cold-formed steel trusses that is certified by the Truss Plate Instifute’s
Quality Assurance Program.
4. A fabricator of wood frusses that is certified by the Truss Plate Institute’s Quality
Assurarice Program.

(Amd) 1704.2.2 2
not required whi

3.

Such fabricatoy

lor} 1704.4 or

i:j’s shall not be exempt from special inspections required by Sections 1704.3,
1704.6. At the completion of fabrication, the certified fabricator shall submit a

certificate of compliance to the building official stating that the work was performed in

accordance with the approved construction documents.

CHAPTER 18 ;

Sec. 39 Sect

- SOILS AND FOUNDATIONS

1

on 29- 252-1d, State Building Code —~ 2005 Connecticut Supplement, Chapter

18, Sectlon 18

(Amd) 1805 2£
walls, piers an
frost by one 0(

1.
§§
|

i

05.2.1, of the 2003 International Building Code, is amended as foliows:

1 Frost protection. Except where otherwise protected from frost, foundation
d other permanent supports of buildings and structures shall be protected from
more of the following methods:

Extendmg a minimum of 42 inches below finished grade;



39 A REV.1/77
STATE OF CONNECTICUT

REGULATION

of

Page 19 of 55 pages

NAME OF AGENCY
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY

Concerning
SUBJECT MATTER OF REGULATIONS

STATE BUILDING CODE-2005 CONNECTICUT
SUPPLEMENT - 2009 AMENDMENT

{

2. Construction in accordance with ASCE 32-01; or

3. Erecting an solid rock.
Exceptloi'l: Free-standing buildings or structures meeting all of the following
conditiong shall not be required to be protected:
1. Ciassn‘;ed in importance category | (see Table 1604.5);
2. Area oé‘[400] 800 square feet or less; and
3. Eave r};elght of 10 feet or less.

Footings shall nat be cast on frozen soil.
H 1

Sec. 40. Section

18, of the 2003 |

(NEW) (Add) 18

29-252-1d, State Building Code ~ 2005 Connecticut Supplement, Chapter

%ﬁternationa[ Building Code, is amended to add:

96.2 Guards. Retaining walls with a difference in finished grade from the top

of the wall to the bottom of the wall that is greater than 4 feet shall be provided with guards

complying with
driveway on the

Sections 1012.2 and 1012.3 when there is a walking surface, parking lot or
high side located closer than 2 feet to the retaining wall. For the purposes of

this section, grciss planting beds or landscaped areas shall not be considered a walking

surface.

CHAPTER 27 -

ELECTRICAL

Sec. 41. Séctiop 29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement, Chapter

27, of the 2003 ||

(NEW) (Add) 27
for the purpose;

nternational Building Code, is amended to add:

02.2.20 Electric fire pumps. Buildings provided with standby electrical power
of continuing operations or occupancy shall provide Type 60 standby power

for any electric fire pump installed to provide an adequate water supply or minimum operating

pressure to are

quired automatic sprinkler system.

ELEVATORS AND CONVEYING SYSTEMS

CHAPTER 30 -

Sec. 42. S‘écﬁo}‘t 29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Suppiement, Chapter

30, of the 2003}

(NEW) (Amd) 3

nternational Building Code, is amended to add:

;906 4 Machine rooms and machinery spaces. Elevator machine rooms and

machinery spat,es shall be enclosed with construction having a fire-resistance rating not less
than the requlred rating of the hoistway enclosure served by the machinery. Openings shall be
protected with Eassembtaes having a fire-resistance rating not less than that required for the

hoistway enclosure doors.
Exceptﬂon Machine rooms and enclosed machine spaces that do not share a wall

with ’thei

hoistway and are located remotely from the hoistway shall be permitted to be

protected by an automatic fire-extinguishing system or be separated from the
remamder of the building by fire barriers having a fire-resistance rating of not less than
one hour with %4-hour-rated opening protectives.

E?
CHAPTER 31 i—

SPECIAL CONSTRUCTION

Sec. 43. Sectifén 29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Conneclicut Supplement, Chapter

31, of the 2003 |

(NEW) (Amd),
STRUCTU RESE‘)

nternational Building Code, is amended to add:

SECTION 3103 TEMPORARY TENTS, CANOPIES AND MEMBRANE

Sec. 44, Sectsgan 29-252-1d, State Building Code ~ 2005 Connecticut Supplement, Chapter
31, Sections 3103 1 and 3103.1.1, of the 2003 International Building Code, are amended as

fo!lows




39A REV. 177 o
: STATE OF CONNECTICUT Page 20 of 55 pages

REGULATION

of

NAME OF AGENCY
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY

Concerning
SUBJECYT MATTER OF REGULATIONS

STATE BUILDING CODE-2005 CONNECTICUT
SUPPLEMENT - 2009 AMENDMENT

(Amd) 3103.1 General. The provisions of this section shall apply to [structures, including]
tents, canopies jand other membrane structures, erected for a period of less than 180
consecutive calendar days out of any 365 consecutive calendar days. Those erected for a
longer period of t; me shall compiy with applicable sections of this code.

Exceptlm The Connecticut Tent and Portable Shelter Code shall apply to the
foliowing tents and portable shelters when such tents and portable shelters are not erected on
the grounds of ofie- and two-family dwellings for private parties and no admission is charged:

1. Tents erected for less than 180 consecutive calendar days out of any 365 conseculive
calendar days with an occupancy of 100 or more persons or covering an area in
excess of 1,200 square feet.

2. Portable i:heiters erected for less than 180 consecutive calendar days out of any 365
consecuttve calendar days with an occupancy of 100 or more persons.

(Amd) 31 03.1. f Permit required. All temporary structures that cover an area in excess of
120 square feet% including all connecting areas or spaces with a common means of egress or
entrance that are used or intended to be used for the gathering together of 10 or more
persons, shall rtot be erected, operated or maintained for any purpose without obtaining a
permit from the code official. [Tents used exclusively for recreational camping purposes shall
be exempt from. the above requiremenis.]

Exceptu}ns

1. Teﬂts iess than 350 square feet total area.

2. Tegrﬁts 900 square feet and smaller in tofal area when occupied by fewer
_ than 50 persons, which have no heating appliances, no installed electrical
- service and are erected for fewer than 72 hours.

3.  Tents used exclusively for recreational camping purposes.

?

Sec. 45. Séctlcn 29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement, Chapter
31, of the 2003 Entemattonal Building Code, is amended to add:

(NEW) (De[) 31 !4 11 Ventilation. Delete section in its entirety without substitution.

(NEW) (Amd) g’105 3 Design and construction. Awnings and canopies shall be designed
and constructeg: o withstand wind or other lateral loads and live loads as required by Chapter
16 with due allowance for shape, open construction and similar features that relieve the
pressures or loads. Structural members shall be protected to prevent deterioration. Awnings
shall have frames of noncombustible material, fire-retardant-treated wood, wood of Type IV
size, or 1 hour construction with combustible or noncombustible covers and shall be either
fixed, retractabk, folding or collapsible.

Exceptuons

1. Fixéd awnings shall not be required to be designed to resist wind loads in excess
of 9@ mph.

2. Retr actable awnings shall not be required to be designed to resist wind or snow
Ioaci‘s.

(NEW) (Amd) 13107.1 General. Signs shall be designed, constructed and maintained in
accordance wif h Appendix H of this code.

Sec. 46. Secti :)n 29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement, Chapter
31, Section 3109.1.1, of the 2003 International Building Code, is amended as follows:

(Add) 3109.1.71 Health Department [regulation] requiations. No person shall construct,
substantially a ter or reconstruct a swimming pool until the construction documents and water
discharge: pE‘O‘E!ISIOI"!S have been approved by the Department of Public Health, in accordance
with the reguiatlons adopted pursuant to section 19a-36 of the Connecticut General Statutes.
Excepﬂzlon Swimming pools accessory to {Owner-occupned] owner-occupied,
detachied one- two- or three-family residences and swimming pools accessory {o a
I

H




39 A REV. 1/77
STATE OF CONNECTICUT

REGULATION

of

Page 21 of 55 pages

NAME OF AGENCY
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY

Concerning
SUBJEECT WMATTER OF REGULATIONS

STATE BUILDING CODE-2005 CONNECTICUT
SUPPLEMENT — 2009 AMENDMENT

o
single om,—famiiv townhouse where the pool is intended to be used exclusively by the
owner and invited guests.

Sec. 47, Sebtsor
31, of the 2003 ik

29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement, Chapter
lternattonal Building Code, is amended tc add:

(NEW) (Amd) 3109411 Openings. Openings in residential swimming pool barriers as
defined by the except:on to Section 3108.1.1 shall not allow passage of a 4-inch-diameter
sphere. Openan(ﬁs in public swimming pool barriers shall not allow passage of a 2-inch
diameter Sphere

(NEW) (Add) 311’09 4.1.7.1 Gates in accessible routes. Access doors or gates in barrier
walls and fenceq protecting pools, spas and hot tubs shall be permitted to have operable parts
of the release of latch on self-latching devices at 54 inches maximum and 48 inches minimum
above the finished floor or ground, providing the self-latching devices are not also self-locking
devices, operated by means of a key, electronic opener or integral combination lock.
}

Sec. 48. Sectlon 29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Suppiement Chapter
31, Section 3109 5, of the 2003 International Building Code, is amended as follows:
{Amd) 3109 5 Ii.ntrapment avoidance. Entrapment avoidance for newly_construcied pools

and spas shaligbe in accordance with [the provisions of Section 11 of ANSI/NSPI-1 2003]
Sections 3109. 5 1 to 3109.5.5, inclusive. Pools and spas undergoing structural alierations or

repairs, or alte

rations or repairs to the pool circulation system shall comply with Sections

3109.5.2 and 3’

09.5.3,

Sec. 49, Séctzc

f
n 29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement, Chapter
international Building Code, is amended to add:

31, of the 2:003
(NEW) (Add)

throughout the
systems, or mu
against user en

:_5109.5.1 General. Suction cutlets shall be designed to produce circulation
pool, spa or hot tub. Single outlet systems, such as automatic vacuum cleaner
ltiple suction outlets whether isolated by valves or otherwise shall be protected
rapment.

|
(NEW) (Add) 31109.5.2 Suction fittings. All pool and spa suction outlets shall be provided with
a cover that ccﬁnforms with ANSI/ASME A112.19.8-2007 or with an approved channel drain
system.

:i
il

ExceptEOn' Surface skimmers.

{(NEW) (Add) 3109 5.2.1 Fitting maintenance. Any pool, spa or hot tub with a broken, icose
or missing suctlon outlet cover shall be immediately placed out of service until repairs are
completed and approved

(NEW) (Add) 3’! 09.5.3 Atmospheric vacuum relief system required. All pool and spa single
or multiple out]et circulation systems other than pools equipped only with surface skimmers
shall be equ:pped with atmospheric vacuum relief. Such vacuum relief systems shalil include at
least one appreved or engineered method of the following fype:

1. SafPty vacuum release system conforming o ASME A112.18.17, or

2. An %approved gravity drainage system operating through a surge tank.

(NEW) (Add) 3109 5.4 Dual drain separation. Single or multiple pump circulation systems
shaﬂ be provucked with a minimum of two (2) suction outlets of the approved type. A minimum
horizontal or vertical distance of three (3) feet shall separate such outlets. The separation
distance shall be measured from near point of opening to near point of opening. These suction
outlets shall be piped so that water is drawn through them simultaneously, distributed as
evenly as pos&ble through a vacuum relief protected line {o the pump or pumps.



39 A REV. 177
STATE OF CONNECTICUT

REGULATION

of

Page 22 of 55 pages

NAME OF AGENCY
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY

Concerning

SUBJECT MATTER OF REGULATIONS

STATE BUILDING CODE-2005 CONNECTICUT
SUPPLEMENT — 2009 AMENDMENT

(NEW) (Add) 31@9 5.5 Pool cleaner fittings. Where provided, vacuum or pressure cleaner
fitting(s) shall be located in an accessible position(s) at least six (6) and not greater than
twelve (12) mchgs below the minimum operational water level or as an attachment to the
skimmer(s). |

i

CHAPTER 33 — SAFEGUARDS DURING CONSTRUCTION

29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement, Chapter
7, of the 2003 Infernational Building Code, is amended as follows:

Sec. 50. Sectior
33, Section 3303.

molition of structures. The demolition of structures shall be conducted in
accordance with|[sections 29-401-1 to 29-401-5, inclusive, of the Regulations of Connecticut
State Agencies; known as] the State Demolition Code as found in chapter 541 of the
Connecticut Genera% Statutes|, and Section 110.0] and with Chapter 33 of this code.

(Add) 3303.7 De

CHAPTER 34 EXEST[NG STRUCTURES

Sec. 51. Sectlop 29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement, Chapter
34, of the 2003 IntemationaE Building Code, is amended to add:

(NEW) (Amd) 3!
existing structug
tread depth reql
space and corasi

103.4 Stairways. An alteration or the replacement of an existing stairway in an
> shall not be required to comply with the maximum riser height and minimum
lirements of a new stairway as outlined in Section 1009.3 where the existing
ruction will not allow a reduction in pitch or slope.

(NEW) Add) 3403 5 Means of egress. in addition io the requirements of this code, means of
egress in ex:shng bualdmgs undergoing additions, alterations or repairs shall meet the
requirements of the provisions of Part IV of the Connecticut State Fire Safety Code for the
proposed occup;z»ancy

(NEW) (Amd) .;}406.3 Stairways. Existing stairways in an existing structure shall not be
required to comply with the maximum riser height and minimum tread depth requirements of a
new stairway as outlined in Section 1009.3 where the existing space and construction will not
allow a reductian in pitch or slope.

' {
%06 4 Means of egress. In addition to the requirements of this code, means of
ng buildings undergoing change of occupancy shall meet the requirements of

of Part IV of the Connecticut State Fire Safety Code for the proposed

(NEW) (Add) 3
egress in existi
the provisions|!
occupancy. |
13408.1 Conformance. Buildings or structures moved into or within the
jurisdiction sha!l comply with the provisions of this code for new structures.

Except&on Buildings or structures moved into or within the jurisdiction shall be

per_m;ttod to comply with the 2003 International Existing Building Code for relocated or

(NEW) (Amd)|

moved

(NEW) (Amd)
maintenance,
those identified

bu;ldmgs or structures.

l34991 Scope. The provisions of Sections 3408.1 through 3409.8 apply fo
:‘hange of occupancy, additions and alterations to existing buildings, including
as historic buildings.

Excep&aon Type B dwelling or sleeping units required by Section 1107 are not

reguires
the exi

(NEW) (Amd)g
undergo a cha

1. Atleas

d to be provided in existing buildings and facilities undergoing alteration or in
atmg portion of buildings to which additions are being made.

13409.3 Change of occupancy. Existing buildings, or portions thereof, that
nge of group or occupancy shall have all of the following accessible features:
one accessible building entrance.




39A REV. 477

ok w

8
9.

STATE OF CONNECTICUT Page 23 of 55 pages

REGULATION

of
i NAME OF AGENCY

DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY

Concerning
SUBJTECT WMATTER OF REGULATIONS

STATE BUILDING CODE-2005 CONNECTICUT
SUPPLEMENT - 2009 AMENDMENT

i

1

.}l

At least oi?éae accessible route from an accessible building entrance to primary function

areas.

Signage ¢
Accefssabl
At least @
provided.
At least o]

%mp!ying with Section 1110.

e parking, where parking is being provided.

ne accessible passenger loading zone, when passenger loading zones are
%

ne accessible route connecting accessible parking and accessible passenger

loading zones to an accessible entrance.
Al least cne accessible toilet room or foilet and bathing facility per gender complying

with Secti

. Atleasto

on 1108.2.
ne accessible means of egress complying with Section 1007.

Type A aﬁd Type B units as required by Section 1107.

i

i

Where it is tec ntcaliy infeasible as defined in Section 3402.1 {o comply with the new
construction standards for any of these requirements for a change of group or occupancy, the

above items she

occupancy thatfncorporates any alterations or additions shall comply with this section and

Sections 3409.4,

(NEW) (Amd) 3
dwelling or sleeping units are being altered or added, the requirements of Section 1107 for
Accessible, Type A or Type B units and Chapter 9 for accessible alarms apply only to the

quantity of épacés being altered or added.

il conform to the maximum extent technically feasible. Change of group or

3409.5, 3409.6 and 3409.7.

409.7.7 Dwelling or sleeping units. Where -1, -2, -3, R-1, R-2 or R-4

(NEW) (Add) 34;10 1.1 Means of egress. [n addition to the requirements of this code, means
of egress in existing bu;!dmgs utilizing the compliance alternatives of Section 3410 shall meet
the requsrements of the provisions of Part IV of the Connecticut State Fire Safety Code for the

proposed occuptancy

i
]




39A REV.1/77

;
i
|
|

]
;
i
§

STATE OF CONNECTICUT

REGULATION

of

| WAME OF AGENCY

DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY

Concerning
SUBJECT MATTER OF REGULATIONS

STATE BUILDING CODE-2005 CONNECTICUT
SUPPLEMENT - 2002 AMENDMENT

Page 24 of 55 pages

¥
i
:
I

|
|
CHAPTER 35 — REFERENCED STANDARDS

Sec. 52. Seétion
35, of the 2003 lmtema’aonai Building Code, is amended as follows:

29 252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement, Chapter

Add the following

standard under ASME:

ANSUASME A112.

2.19.8-2007 Suction Fittings for Use in Swimming Pools, Wading Pools,

(Amd) ‘CC

Spasand Hot TUbS. .. ..o erieass

3109.5.2

international Code Council, Inc.
4051 W. Flossmoor Rd.
Country Club Hills, I} [60478-

| 5795160478
Standard Referenced
reference in code
number ¢ Title section number
ICC/ANSI El Accessible and Usable .. .. ... 406.2.2, 907.9.1.3, 1007.8.5, 1010.1,
A117.1—03 Buildings and Facilities 1010.6.5, 1010.9, 1011.3, 1101.2, 1102.1,
’ 1103.2.13, 1106.8, 1107.2, 1109.2.2, 1109.3,
1109.4, 1109.8, 1109.15, 3001.3, 3409.5,
o 3409.7.2, 3409.7.3
ICC 300—02 ICC Standard on Bleachers, Folding  .................. 1024.1.1
: and Telescopic Seating, and
. Grandstands
[EBC—03 © | International Existing . ... ...l 101.2
' Building Code™
[ECC—{03]106 | International Energy ... 101.4.7, [1202.3.2)
‘ Conservation Code ® 1203.3.2, 1301.1.1, 1403.2
IMC—03 | international Mechanical Code® ... ...... 101.4.3, 201.3,
307.9, 406.4.2, 406.6.3,
. 406.6.5, 409.3, 412.4.6,
414.1.2, 414.1.2.1, 414.1.2.2,
414.3,415.7.1.4, 415.7.2,
| 415.7.2.8, 415.7.3, 415.7.4,
415.9.11.1, 416.3, 603.1,
707.2,716.2.2, 716.5.4,
716.6.1, 716.6.2, 716.6.3,
| 717.5, 719.1, 903.2.12.1,
904.2.1, 904.11, 908.6,
909.1, 909.10.2, 1014.5,
1016.4.1, 1203.1, 1203.2.1,
1203.4.2, 1203.4.2.1, 1203.5,
1209.3, 2304.5, 3004.3.1,
§ 3410.6.7.1, 3410.6.8
IPC—03 5 international Plumbing Code ® .. 101.4.4, 201.3, 415.7 .4,
- 717.5, 803.3.5, 1206.3.3,
1503.4, 1807.4.3, 2901.1,
% 2902.1.1, 3305.1, 3401.3
SBCCI SSTD | Standard for Hurricane Resistant ..., .. 1609.1.1, 2308.2.1
10—99 1 Residential Construction
SBCCI SSTD;; Test Standard for Determining Wind ... .. .. 1715.2.1, 1715.2.2
1M—97 Resistance of Concrete or Clay Roof
i

i
i



32 A REV. 1/77 !

STATE OF CONNECTICUT

REGULATION

of

NAME OF AGENCY

DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY

Concerning

SUBJECT MATTER OF REGULATIONS

STATE BUILDING CODE-2005 CONNECTICUT
SUPPLEMENT - 2009 AMENDMENT

i - Tiles
UBC Standard | ExpansionindexTest ... ... ... .. 1802.3.2
18-2 »
v 41 National Fire Protection
{(Amd) N FPA Association
- 1 Batterymarch Park
. P.O. Box 9101
- Quincy, MA 02268-9101
Standard Referenced
reference | in code
number . Title section number
11—02 i LowExpansion Foam ... oo o 904.7
11A—99 . Medium- and High-Expansion ............. ... ... ... .... 904.7
' Foam Systems
12—00 ' Carbon Dioxide Extinguishing .................... 904.8, 904.11
{  Systems
12A—04 | Halon 1301 Fire Extinguishing ......... .. ... ... ........ 904.9
. Systems
13—02  Installation of Sprinkler ....704.12,707.2, 903.3.1.1, 903.3.2,
. Systems 903.3.5.1.1, 904.11, 907.8,
1621.3.10.1, 3104.5, 3104.9
13D—02 - Installation of Sprinkler ... .. Ll 903.1.2, 903.3.1.3,
. Systems in One- and Two- 003.3.5.1.1
Family Dwellings and
o Manufactured Homes
13R—02 i Installation of Sprinkler ... ... 903.1.2, 803.3.1.2, 903.3.5.1.1,
| Systems in Residential 903.3.5.1.2, 903.4
Occupancies Up to and
Including Four Stories in
| Height
14—03 installation of Standpipe, @ ....... 905.2, 905.3.4, 905.4.2, 905.8
Private Hydrants and Hose
System
16—03 : Installation Foam-Water .. ... ... .. ... . L. 904.7, 904.11
Sprinkler and Foam-Water
§ Spray Systems
17—02 Dry Chemical Extinguishing ~ .................... 904.8, 904.11
z Systems
17A—02 Wet Chemical Extinguishing . ........... ... .... 904.5, 904.11
Systems
30—03 Flammable and Combustible ... ... ... ... ... ... L. 415.3
Liquids Code
32—04 ! Drycleaning Plants ... . 415.7.4
4001 Storage and Handlingof ... ... .. . L 409.1
Cellulose Nitrate Motion
Picture Film
61-—02 Prevention of Fires and Dust ... ... ... ............ .. 415.7.1
Explosions in Agricultural and
o Food Product Facilities
7202 National Fire Alarm Code ... ... 505.4, 901.6, 903.4.1, 904.3.5,
907.2, 907.2.1, 907.2.1.1, 907.2.10,
907.2.10.4, 907.2.11.2, 907.2.11.3,
907.2.12.2.3, 907.2.12.3, 907.4, 907.5,

80—99

Fire Doors and Fire Windows

907.9.2, 907.10, 907.14, 907.16,
907.17, 911.1, 3006.5
......... 302.1.1.1,715.3,715.4.6.1,

Page 25 of 55 pages



39 A REV. Y77 !
3 STATE OF CONNECTICUT Page 26 of 55 pages
REGULATION
| of
. NAME OF AGENCY

DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY

Concerning
SUBJECT MATTER OF REGULATICONS

! STATE BUILDING CODE-2005 CONNECTICUT

SUPPLEMENT - 2009 AMENDMENT

715.4.4,715.4.7.2, 715.5, 1008.1.3.3

Standard ‘ Referenced
reference | in code
number : Title section number

85—04 | Boiler and Combustion System ... ........ ... . ..., 415.7.1
. Hazards Code

. {Note: NFPA 8503 has been

i incorporated into NFPA 85)

99-02 i Standard for Health Care ............. 407.9, 407.10, 407 .11,
Facilities 420.2, 420.3
101—03 . LifeSafetyCode L 1024.6.2
110—02 Emergency and Standby ... .. Lo 27021
- Power Systems
111—01 Stored Electrical Energy ™ ... 27021
» Emergency and Standby
i Power Systems
120—04 | Coal PreparationPlants ... ... ... . ... ... ... 415.7 .1
231C—98 See NFPA 13-2002 . 507.2
252—03 Standard Methods of Fire ..., .. 715.3.1,715.3.2, 715.3.3,
| Tests of Door Assemblies 715.3.4.1

253—00 Test for Critical Radiant Fluxof . ........ ... .. 406.6.4, 804.2, 804.3

- Floor Covering Systems Using

a Radiant Heat Energy Source

257-—00 Standard for Fire Testfor  ...... 715.3.3, 715.4, 715.4.1, 715.4.2

| Window and Glass Block

1 Assemblies

259—03 = Test Method for Potential Heat . ............. 2603.4.1.10, 2603.5.3

o of Building Materials

265—02 Standard Method of Fire Tests .. ...... 803.6.1, 803.6.1.1, 803.6.1.2

for Evaluating Room Fire

Growth

Contribution of Textile Wall
’ Coverings
268—01 Standard Test Methodfor ... .. ... ... ... 1406.2.1, 1406.2.1.1,
‘k Determining Ignitibility of 1406.2.1.2, 2603.5.7

Exterior Wall Assemblies

Using a Radiant Heat Energy

Source

285—98 Standard Method of Testfor ~ ............... 1407.10.4, 2603.5.5

the Evaluation of Flammability

Characteristics of Exterior

Non-load-bearing Wall

Assemblies Containing

| Combustible Components

286—00 Standard Method of Fire Test  ........... 402.14.4, 803.2, 803.2.1,
’ for Evaluating Coniribution of 803.5, 2603.4, 2603.8

Wall and Ceiling Interior Finish

to Room Fire Growth

40904 Standard on Aircraft Hangers .. ............. ... 412.2.8,412.4.5
418—01 Standard for Heliports .. ... 412.5.6
651—98 Machining and Finishingof ... ... ... ... ... ... ... 41571

Aluminum and the Production
and Handling of Aluminum
Powders




38 A REV. 1/77
STATE OF CONNECTICUT Page 27 of 55 pages

REGULATION

of

NAME OF AGENCY
’ DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY

Concerning

SUBJECT MATTER OF REGULATIONS

STATE BUILDING CODE-2005 CONNECTICUT
SUPPLEMENT -~ 2009 AMENDMENT

Standard Referenced
reference = | in code
number & Title section number
654—00 = | Preventionof Fire&Dust .. ....... ... . ... ... 415.7.1
| Explosions from the
| Manufacturing, Processing,
and Handling of Combustible
. Particulate Solids
85501 . Prevention of Sulfur Fires and  .......... ... ... .. 415.7 1
i Explosions
664—02 Prevention of Fires Explosions ... ... ... .. .. ... ... ... 415,71

in Wood Processing and

. Woodworking Facilities

701—04 . Standard Methods of Fire ... .... 802.1, 805.1, 805.2, 3102.3.1,
 Tests for Flame-Propagation of 3105.3

i Textiles and Films

704—01 ' Standard Systemforthe = ...................

' |dentification of the Hazards of

Materials for Emergency

Response
Manufacture, Transportation, ... .............. 307.5.2, 415.3.1

! and Storage of Fireworks and
| Pyrotechnic Articles

Clean Agent Fire Extinguishing . ............ ... ... ... ..
Systems

414.7.2, 4152

1124—{03] 06

il

2001—04

Sec. 53. Sectic;{n 29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement, Chapter

35, of the 2003 International Building Code, is amended to add:

i
i

(NEW) (Amd)

S P RI Single-Ply Roofing Institute
’ 411 Waverly Oaks Road

i Suite 3318

| Waltham, MA 02452
Standard | Referenced
reference I in code
number Title section number
E£S-1-03 ; Wind Design Standard forEdge ™ ... ... Lo L 1504 5

; Systems Used with Low Slope Roofing

| Systems
RP-4-02 Wind Design Guide for Ballasted ... ... ........... 1504.4

Single-ply Roofing Systems




39 A REV. 1777

Sec. 54. Section

K, of the 2003 International Building Code, is amended as follows:

1
¥
]
P

;

3

1

STATE OF CONNECTICUT

REGULATION

of .

Page 28 of 55 pages

NAME OF AGENCY
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY

Concerning

SUBJECT MATTER OF REGULATIONS

STATE BUILDING CODE-2005 CONNECTICUT
SUPPLEMENT - 2009 AMENDMENT

i;29-252-‘€d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement, Appendix

(Add) APPENDIX K
Municipality Ground | Basic MCE Spectral
Snow Wind Accelerations
; Load, Py| Speed S, Sy
(psf) (3 sec.
gust)

Andover 30 100 [0.271]0.234 [0.083] 0.063
Ansonia 30 105 [0.308] 0.255 [0.086] 0.063
Ashford 35 100 [0.267]0.230 [0.083] 0.063
Avon 35 95 [0.276] 0.241 [0.086] 0.064
Barkhamsted 40 90 [0.270]1 0.236 [0.086] 0.065
Beacon Falls 30 100 [0.303] 0.253 [0.086] 0.064
Berlin 30 100 [0.281] 0.242 [0.08510.063
Bethany 30 105 [0.290] 0.249 {0.085] 0.063
Bethel . 30 95 [0.341] 0.283 {0.089] 0.066
Bethlehem . 35 95 [0.291] 0.253 [0.087] 0.065
Bloomfield | 35 95 [0.274] 0.239 [0.085] 0.064
Bolton 30 100 [0.270] 0.235 [0.084] 0.063
Bozrah 30 110 [0.262] 0.225 {0.080] 0.060
Branford 30 110 [0.278] 0.233 {0.082] 0,061
Bridgeport . | 30 110 [0.340] 0.270 [0.088] 0.064
Bridgewater ; 35 95 [0.323] 0.267 267 [0.088] 0.066
Bristol i 35 95 [0.279] 0.245 [0.086] 0.064
Brookfield | 35 g5 [0.323] 0. 2?5 [0.088] 0.066
Brooklyn = 35 105 [0.264] 0.229 [0.082] 0.062
Burlington 35 95 [0.276] 0.243 [0.086] 0.064
Canaan 40 90 [0.265] 0.230 [0.086] 0.065
Canterbury | 35 105 [0.262] 0.227 {0.080] 0.061
Canton | 35 95 [0.276] 0.240 {0.086] 0.065
Chaplin 35 105 [0.265] 0.231 [0.083] 0.062
Cheshire 30 100 [0.284] 0.244 {0.085] 0.063
Chester 30 110 {0.269] 0.225 [0.081] 0.060
Clinton 30 115 [0.263] 0.219 [0.079] 0.059
Colchester 30 105 [0.265] 0.230 [0.081] 0,061
Colebrook 40 90 [0.265] 0.231 [0.086] 0.065
Columbia 30 105 [0.269] 0.232 [0.083] 0.062
Cornwall 40 90 [0.278]0.242 [0.087] 0.065
Coventry : 30 100 {0.268] 0.233 [0.084] 0.063
Cromwell | 30 100 [0.279] 0.239 [0.085] 0.063
Danbury = | 30 95 [0.350] 0.286 [0.090] 0,066
Darien | 30 105 [0.386] 0.313 [0.091] 0, 067
Deep River | 30 115 [0.269] 0.222 [0.081] 0.
Derby | 30 105 [0.308] 0.255 [0.086] 0.
Durham = | 30 105 [0.278] 0.235 [0.084] 0
Eastford | 40 100 [0.264] 0.229 [0.083] O 063
East Granby | 35 20 [0.270] 0.235 [0.085] 0.065
East Haddam 30 110 [0.268] 0.226 [0.081] 0.060
East Hampton 30 105 [0.274] 0.234 [0.08310.062
East Hartford | 30 95 [0.273] 0.238 [0.085] 0.064
East Haven 30 110 [0.283] 0.238 [0.083] 0.061




39A REV. 477
STATE OF CONNECTICUT

REGULATION
of

Page 29 of 55 pages

NAME OF AGENGY
l DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY

Concerning

%
|

§ SUBJECT MATTER OF REGULATIONS

STATE BUILDING CODE-2005 CONNECTICUT
SUPPLEMENT — 2009 AMENDMENT

Municipality Ground | Basic MCE Spectral
o Snow | Wind Accelerations

Load, P,| Speed S, S;

{psf) (3 sec.

Gust)
Eastlyme & | 30 115/120°| 10.258}0.215 [0.078] 0.058
Easton 0 30 105 [0.340] 0.280 [0.088] 0.065
East Windsor 35 95 [0.269] 0.235 10.085] 0.064
Ellington =~ 35 95 [0.267]10.233 [0.085] 0.064
Enfield ! 35 o5 [0.265] 0.233 [0.085] 0.065
Essex | 30 115 [0.265] 0.219 [0.080] 0.059
Fairfield = | 30 |105/110°| [0.350]0.279 [0.088] 0.064
Farmington. || 35 95 [0.278] 0.242 [0.085] 0.064
Frankiin = | 30 105 [0.269] 0.228 [0.082] 0.061
Glastonbury | 30 100 [0.275] 0.238 [0.084] 0.063
Goshen | 40 90 [0.277]10.242 [0.086] 0.065
Granby 35 90 [0.265] 0.234 [0.086] 0.065
Greenwich | 30 100 [0.407] 0.336 [0.093] 0.069
Griswold 30 110 [0.262] 0.225 [0.080] 0.060
Groton 30 120 [0.253] 0.209 [0.077] 0.057
Guilford 30 110 [0.273] 0.229 [0.081] 0.060
Haddam ; 30 110 [0.272] 0.229 [0.082] 0.061
Hamden 30 [105/110°] [0.284]0.243 [0.084] 0.062
Hampton 35 105 [0.265] 0.229 [0.083]0.062
Hartford 30 95 [0.274] 0.238 [0.085] 0.064
Hartland 40 90 [0.276] 0.232 [0.086] 0.065
Harwinton - 35 95 [0.277] 0.244 [0.086] 0.065
Hebron 30 105 [0.271] 0.234 [0.083] 0.062
Kent _,: 40 90/swr' | [0.288]0.252 [0.088] 0.066
Killingly =~ | 40 105 [0.263] 0.229 [0.083] 0.062
Kiflingworth | 30 110 [0.2721 0.226 [0.082] 0.060
Lebanon = | 30 105 [0.269] 0.230 [0.082].0.061
Ledyard 30 115 [0.253] 0.215 [0.077] 0.058
Lisbon @ 30 110 [0.262] 0.225 [0.080] 0.060
Litchfield = | 40 95 [0.283] 0.248 [0.087] 0.065
Lyme I 30 115 [0.255] 0.214 [0.077] 0.058
Madison i 30 [110/115°%) [0.268]0.224 [0.080] 0.060
Manchester | 30 100 [0.27210.237 [0.085] 0.063
Mansfield | | 35 100 [0.268] 0.231 [0.084] 0.062
Marlborough | 30 105 [0.274] 0.235 [0.083] 0.062
Meriden = | 30 100 [0.280] 0.241 [0.084] 0.063
Middlebury 35 95 [0.294] 0.254 [0.086] 0.064
Middlefield | 30 105 [0.278] 0.238 [0.084] 0.062
Middletown 30 105 [0.279] 0.238 [0.084] 0.062
Milford I 30 110 [0.313] 0.253 [0.085] 0.062
Monroe 30 100 [0.324] 0.268 [0.087] 0.085
Montville 30 115 [0.255] 0.218 [0.078] 0.059
Morris = | 35 95 [0.283] 0.249 [0.087] 0.085
Naugatuck 30 100 [0.28710.251 [0.086] 0.064
New Britain | 30 95 [0.278] 0.242 [0.085] 0.064




39 A REV. 1/77
STATE OF CONNECTICUT

REGULATION

of
’ NAME OF AGENCY

| DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY

Page 30 of 55 pages

Concerning

SUBJECT MATTER OF REGULATIONS

STATE BUILDING CODE~2005 CONNECTICUT
SUPPLEMENT - 2009 AMENDMENT

Municipality. Ground | Basic MCE Spectral
% Show Wind Accelerations
Load, P,;{ Speed S 5
(psh (3 sec.
gust)
New Canaan 30 100 [0.380] 0.311 [0.091} 0.067
New Fairfield 35 95 [0.331] 0.281 [0.089] 0.066
New Hartford 40 90 [0.270] 0.240 [0.086] 0.065
New Haven 30 110 [0.290] 0.243 [0.085] 0.062
Newington 30 100 [0.276] 0.240 [0.085] 0.084
New London 30 120 [0.24710.210 [0.075] 0.057
New Milford 35 95 [0.304] 0.265 [0.088] 0.066
Newtown 30 95 [0.329]0.274 [0.088] 0,065
Norfolk 40 90 [0.265] 0.232 [0.086] 0,065
North Branford | 30 110 [0.278] 0.233 [0.082] 0.061
North Canaan 40 90 [0.279] 0.230 [0.086] 0,065
North Haven | 30 §105/110%F [0.284]0.241 [0.084] 0.062
North Stoningtor: 30 115 [0.256] 0.214 [0.078] 0,058
Norwalk 30  |105/110%] 10.371]0.300 [0.090] 0.066
Norwich 30 110 [0.262] 0.222 [0.080] 0.060
Old Lyme = | 30 [115/120°) [0.255]0.214 [0.077]0.058
Old Saybrook 30 115 [0.259] 0.214 [0.078] 0,058
Orange ’ 30 110 [0.290] 0.250 [0.085] 0.062
Oxford 30 100 [0.303] 0.258 [0.086] 0.064
Plainfield 35 105 [0.262] 0.226 [0.081] 0.061
Plainville 35 95 [0.279] 0.243 [0.086] 0.064
Plymouth 35 95 [0.280] 0.247 [0.086] 0,064
Pomfret 40 100 [0.263] 0.229 [0.083] 0.063
Portiand 30 105 [0.277]10.238 [0.084] 0,062
Preston , 30 [110/1157 [0.262] 0.221 [0.080] 0,059
Prospect | 30 100 [0.28710.248 10.086] 0.063
Putnam 40 100 [0.263] 0.229 [0.083] 0.063
Redding | 30 100 [0.354] 0.288 [0.089] 0.066
Ridgefield i 30 g5 [0.366] 0.301 [0.090] 0.067
Rocky Hill 30 100 [0.276] 0.239 [0.085] 0.063
Roxbury 35 95 [0.298] 0.262 [0.087] 0.065
Salem ¢ 30 110 [0.265] 0.224 [0.081] 0.060
Salisbury 40 90/swr' | [0.265] 0.231 [0.086] 0,065
Scotland 30 105 [0.265] 0.228 [0.082] 0.061
Seymour = 30 105 [0.303] 0.255 [0.086] 0.064
Sharon 40 90/swr' | [0.272] 0.240 [0.087]0.065
Shelton 30 |105/110°| [0.308]0.260 [0.086] 0,064
Sherman igi 35 90 [0.310] 0.269 [0.088] 0.066
Simsbury 35 95 [0.270] 0.238 [0.086] 0.065
Somers = i 35 95 [0.264] 0.231 [0.085] 0.064
Southbury | 35 95 [0.304] 0.262 [0.087] 0.065
Southington 30 100 [0.283] 0.245 [0.085] 0.064
South Windsor 30 95 [0.273] 0. 237 [0.085] 0.064
Sprague = | 30 105 [0.264] 0. [0.081}0.061
Stafford | 35 95 [0.263] 0. 230 [0.085] 0.064
Stamford | 30 105 [0.400] 0.322 [0.092] 0.068
Sterling | 35 105 [0.262] 0.227 [0.080] 0.061
|




30 A REV. Y77

STATE OF CONNECTICUT

REGULATION

of

Page 31 of 55 pages

NAME OF AGENCY

DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY

Concerning

SUBJECT MATTER OF REGULATIONS

STATE BUILDING CODE-2005 CONNECTICUT
SUPPLEMENT - 2009 AMENDMENT

Municipality Ground | Basic MCE Spectral
f Snow Wind Accelerations
Load, P,j| Speed S. S4
(psf) (3 sec.
Gust)

Stoningion : 30 115/120°] [0.241]10.208 [0.074] 0.057
Stratford ] 30 110 [0.3131 0,262 [0.085] 0.063
Suffield 35 95 10.265] 0.233 10.086] 0.065
Thomaston 35 95 [0.282] 0.248 [0.0861 0.065
Thompson 40 100 [0.233] 0.229 [0.083] 0.063
Tolland 35 100 [0.267] 0.233 [0.085] 0.062
Torrington 40 90 [0.277]10.243 [0.086] 0.065
Trumbut! 30 105/110°| [0.324]0.270 [0.087] 0.064
Union 40 95 [0.263] 0.230 [0.084] 0.064
Vernon | 30 100 [0.272] 0.235 [0.085] 0.064
Voluntown L 30 110 {0.262] 0.223 [0.079] 0.059
Wallingford 30 105 [0.280] 0.240 [0.084] 0.062
Warren = 40 90 [0.279]-0.249 [0.087] 0.065
Washington | 35 95 [0.298] 0.256 {0.087] 0.065
Waterbury | 35 95 {0.285] 0.250 [0.086] 0.064
Waterford 30 115/120%] [0.247]0.210 [0.077] 0.057
Watertown 35 95 [0.287] 0.252 [0.087] 0.065
VWestbrook - 30 115 [0.263]1 0.216 [0.079]0.058
West Hartford 30 95 [0.275] 0.240 [0.085] 0.064
West Haven 30 110 [0.291]1 0.245 [0.084] 0.062
Weston 30 105 [0.36710.292 [0.089] 0.066
Westport 30 §105/110°) [0.353]0.293 [0.089] 0.066
Wethersfield | 30 100 [0.276] 0.239 [0.085] 0.063
Willington i 35 100 [0.266] 0.231 [0.084] 0.063
Wiiton 30 100 [0.367] 0.302 [0.090] 0.067
Winchester | 40 90 [0.27110.236 - {0.086] 0.065
Windham ‘ 30 105 {0.265] 0.229 [0.082] 0.062
Windsor ! 35 95 [0.270] 0.237 [0.085] 0.064
Windsor Locks 35 95 [0.26910.235 [0.085] 0,065
WWolcott 35 95 [0.285] 0.248 {0.086} 0.064
Woodbridge 30 105 [0.290] 0.250 [0.085] 0.063
Woodbury _‘; 35 g5 [0.2011 0.257 [0.0871 0.065
Woodstock | 40 100 [0.263] 0.228 0 228 [0.084] 0.063
Footnotes: .

NN

Western portions of these municipalities lie within the Special Wind Region.
Areas south of 1-95 = 120 mph; areas north of 1-95 = 115 mph

Areas south of Rt. 15 = 110 mph; areas north of Rt. 15 = 105 mph

Areas south of I-95 = 110 mph; areas north of 1-95 = 105 mph

Areas east of Rt. 8 = 110 mph; areas west of Rt. 8 = 105 mph

Areas south of Rt. 80 = 115 mph; areas north of Rt. 80 = 110 mph

Areas south of Rt. 165 = 115 mph; areas north of Rt. 165 = 110 mph
Areas ?soutp of Rt. 184 = 120 mph; areas north of Rt. 184 = 115 mp




438 A REV. 1/77

STATE OF CONNECTICUT Page 32 of 55 pages

REGULATION

of

NAME OF AGENGY
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY

Concerning
SUBJECT MATTER OF REGULATIONS

STATE BUILDING CODE-2005 CONNECTICUT
SUPPLEMENT - 2009 AMENDMENT

AMENDMENTS TO THE ICC/ANSI A117.1-2003

:)n 29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement,
g'ZCIANS! A117.1-2003, is amended to add:

Sec. 55. Secti
Chapter 5, of |

(NEW) Chapteir 5. General Site and Building Elements

04 Stairways Delete Section 504 in its entirety without substitution.

k

on 29-252-1d, State Bultdmg Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement,
.,C/AN81 A1 17 1-2003, is amended to add:

(NEW) (Del) 5

Sec. 56. Secti
Chapter 8, of |

(NEW) Chapteg;r 6. Plumbing Elements and Facilities

(NEW) (Amd) 604.5.3 Swing-up Grab Bars. Where swing-up grab bars are installed in
Type B dwelling units, a clearance of 18 inches minimum from the centerline of the
water closet to any side wall or obstruction shall be provided. A swing-up grab bar shall
be instalied \Mth the centerline of the grab bar 15 % inches from the centerline of the
water closet, :>wmg up grab bars shall be 28 inches minimum in length, measured from
the wall to the, end of the horizontal portion of the grab bar.

10n 29-252-1d, State Bwidlng Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement,
HCCIANSE A117.1-2003, is amended fo add:

Sec. 57. Sec
Chapter 10, 0

er 10. Dwelling Units and Sleeping Units

{NEW) Chapi

(NEW) (Amd) '1004.3 Accessible Route. Accessible routes within Type B dwelling units

shall comply Wlth Section 1004.3.
Exceptlon Exterior spaces less than 60 inches in depth.

i»r
Sec. 58. Sec’non 29-252-1d, State Buiiding Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement,
Chapter 10, &aectlons 1004.3.3 and 1004.13, of ICC/ANSI A117.1-2003, are amended as

follows:

(Add) 100433 [Wheelchair] Turning Space. All [spaces] rooms served by an
accessible route shall provide a [wheeichair] turning space complying with Section 304.

Exception: [Exterior spaces less than 30 inches in depth.] Toilet rooms and
bathrooms n@t required to comply with Sections 1004.11.3.1 or 1004.11.3.2.

[(Add)] LQ_G_J

rescue shaﬂf
section in its

1004.13 Windows. [Each window required for emergency escape and
have operable parts complying with Sections 309.3 and 309.4.] Delete

.entirety without substitution.



4-39A REV.1/77 ; E
STATE OF CONNECTICUT Page 33 of 55 pages

REGULATION

of

NAME OF AGENCY
? DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY

; Concerning
. SUBJECT MATTER OF REGULATIONS

STATE BUILDING CODE-2005 CONNECTICUT
SUPPLEMENT — 2009 AMENDMENT

AMENDME{ENTS TO THE 2003 INTERNATIONAL EXISTING BUILDING CODE

CHAPTER 1 JADM:NlSTRAT;ON

Sec. 56. Sectmn 29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement,
Chapter 1, of twe 2003 Intemationai Existing Building Code, is amended to add:

{(NEW) (Add) 3]01 13 Means of egress. In addition to the requirements of this code,
means of egress in existing buildings shall meet the requirements of the provisions of
Part IV of the Connecticut State Fire Safety Code for the proposed occupancy.

i

CHAPTER § - ALTERATIONS-LEVEL 1

Sec. 60. Section 29-252-1d, State Building Code —~ 2005 Connecticut Supplement,
Chapter 5, Section 505.2, of the 2003 International Existing Building Code, is amended
as follows: |

ﬁ
(Add) 505.2 Minimum standards. In addition to the requirements of this code, means
of egress in Eex:stmg buildings shall meet the requirements of the [existing buildings]
provisions of {the 2003 NFPA 101 Life Safety Code portion] Part 1V of the Connecticut
State Fire Safety Code for the proposed occupancy.

CHAPTERG - ALTERATIONS — LEVEL 2

Sec. 61. Secflon 29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement,
Chapter 6, Se,ctton 605.2, of the 2003 International Existing Building Code, is amended

as follows: };
i
!

i
(Amd) 605.2 §§Genera|. The means of egress shall comply with the requirements of this
section. ;:g
Excepttons
1. \Nhere the work area and the means of egress serving it complies with [the
2@03 NFPA 101 Life Safety Code portion] Part [V of the 2005 Connecticut
State Fire Safety Code.
2. F@r buildings constructed under a permit applied for on or after September 1,
1971 means of egress conforming to the requirements of the State Bmldmg
Code under which the building was constructed shall be considered
oémpilant means of egress providing that no unsafe conditions exist within
tﬁe means of egress.

CHAPTER é CHANGE OF OCCUPANCY

Sec. 62. Segctzon 29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement,
Chapter 8, of the 2003 International Existing Building Code, is amended to add:

(NEW) (Amd) 804.1 General. in addition to the fire protection requirements of Section
812, the following requirements shall apply where a building or portions thereof undergo

a change of occupancy classification.

(NEW) (Ao};i) 804.1.1 Fire sprinkler system. Where a change of occupancy
ciassiﬁcatioh occurs that requires an automatic fire sprinkler system to be provided
based on tE e new occupancy in accordance with Chapter 9 of the 2003 International
Building Code portion of the 2005 State Building Code, such system shall be provided
throughout %he building or portion thereof where the change of occupancy occurs.

l

[




4-39 A REV. 1/77
STATE OF CONNECTICUT Page 34 of 55 pages

| REGULATION
i of
NAME OF AGENCY
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY

Concerning
SUBJECT MATTER OF REGULATIONS

STATE BUILDING CODE-2005 CONNECTICUT
| SUPPLEMENT — 2009 AMENDMENT

(NEW) (Add) ‘804 1.2 Fire alarm and detection system. Where a change of
occupancy cla§3tﬂcatlon occurs that requires a fire alarm and detection system to be
provided base;d on the new occupancy in accordance with Chapter 9 of the 2003
international Building Code portion of the 2005 State Building Code, such system shall
be provided throughout the building or portion thereof where the change of occupancy
OCCurs. Ex:stmg alarm notification appliances shall be automatically activated throughout
the building. Where the building is not equipped with an existing fire alarm system, alarm
notification apphances shall be provided throughout the area where the change of
occupancy ocdurs and shall be automatically activated.

(NEW) (Amd) ;812 5 Accessibility. Existing buildings or portions thereof that undergo a
change of group or occupancy shall have all of the following accessible features:
1. At !easi one accessible building entrance.
2. At Iea<ft one accessible route from an accessible building entrance to primary
functlon areas.
3. Slgnage complying with Section 1110 of the 2003 international Building Code.
4. Acces sible parking, where parking is being provided.
5. At least one accessible passenger loading zone, when passenger loading zones
are provided.
6. At least one accessible route connecting accessible parking and accessible
passenger loading zones to an accessible entrance.
7. At Ieast one accessible toilet room or toilet and bathing facility per gender
complymg with Section 1109.2 of the 2003 International Building Code.
8. At least one accessible means of egress complying with Section 1007 of the
2003 mternatsonai Building Code.
9. Type A and Type B units as required by Section 1107 of the 2003 International
Buiidmg Code.
Where it is tfachmcaliy infeasible as defined in Section 202.1 to comply with the new
construction istandards for any of these requirements for a change of group or
occupancy, the above items shall conform to the requirements to the maximum extent
technically feassbie Changes of group or occupancy that incorporate any alterations or
additions shalll comply with this section and Sections 506.1 and 905.1 as applicable.

%
CHAPTER 14 REFERENCED STANDARDS

Sec. 63. Sectlon 29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement,
Chapter 14, of the 2003 international Existing Building Code, is amended as follows:

L
[

International Code Council, Inc.
{Amd) IC C 4051 West Flossmoor Road
Country Club Hilis, IL [60478-

;; 5795] 60478
Standard Referenced
reference | in code
number Title section number
IBC—03 international Building Code® ... .. ..., 101.2, 102.4.2,

106.1.1.1,

109.3.3, 109.3.8, 110.2, 202, 301.4, 401.4, 402.1, 403.2,
407.1.1.1, 407.1.1.3, Table 407.1.1.2, 407.1.2, 407.2, 407.3.1,
407.3.2.1.1, 407.3.5, 501.3, 502.1, 503.1, 503.2, 503.3, 506.1,
506.1.1, 506.1.7, 506.1.9, 507.2.1, 507.2.2, 601.3, 602.1, 603.2.1,
603.2.3, 603.3.2, 603.4, 603.5.2, 604.2, 604.2.2, 604.2.3, 604.2.4,
604.3, 605.2, 605.3.1, 605.4.3, 605.5, 605.6, 605.7.1, 605.8.1,
605.9.2, 605.10.2, 606.2, 606.3, 607.1, 607.2, 607.3, 607 4,




4-35 A REV. 1/77
STATE OF CONNECTICUT Page 25 of 55 pages

REGULATION

of

NAME OF AGENCY
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY

Concerning
I SUBJECT MATTER OF REGULATIONS -

STATE BUILDING CODE-2005 CONNECTICUT
SUPPLEMENT - 2009 AMENDMENT

607.4.1, 607.4.3,704.1.2, 704.2, 704.2.1, 705.2, 705.3, 707.2,
707.3,707.5.1, 707.6, 707.7, 801.1, 801.3, 802.1, 802.2, 807.1,
807.2,807.3.1, 811.1.1.1, 812.1.1, 812.1.2, 812.3.1, 812.4.1.1,
812412, 812.4.1.3,812.42.1, 812.4.2.3, 812.4.3.1, 812.4.3.3,
812.4.4.1, 812.4.4.3, 812.5, 902.1, 902.2, 903.1, 903.2, 903.3,
903.3.1, 903.3.2, 903.4, 803.5, 904.1, 904.2, 1001.4, 1002.3,
1002.5, 1005.2, 1005.9, 1101.2, 1102.1, 1102.2, 1102.2.1,

il

1102.3, 1102.4, 1102.5, 1102.6, 1201.2.2, 1201.2.3, 1201.2.4,
i 1201.2.5, 1201.3.3, 1201.4.1, 1201.6.1, 1201.6.1.1, 1201.6.2,
] 1201.6.2.1, 1201.6.3.1, 1201.6.3.2, 1201.6.13, 1201.6.4.1,
1201.6.5, 1201.6.5.1, 1201.6.6, 1201.6.7.1, 1201.6.8, 1201.6.9.1,
j 1201.6.10.1, 1201.6.11, 1201.6.11.1, 1201.6.12.1, 1201.6.15.1,

Table 1201.6.15, 1201.6.16.1, 1201.6.17, 1201.6.17.1, 1201.6.18,
1201.6.18.1, 1201.6.19, 1301.6.1, 1301.6.4.1, 1301.6.7, 1306.3

ICC/ANSI Guidelines for Accessible and ... Table 407.1.1.2, 506.1.2,

A117.1—03 Usable Buildings and Facilities 506.1.3
IECC—[03] 06 International Energy ConservationCode .......... 503.3,
| ® 906.1

IMC—03 International Mechanical Code @ . ..... 101.2, 503.3, 609.1,
- ® 702.1.1,

o 702.2.1, 809.1, 1201.6.7.1, 1201.6.8,

o 1201.6.8.1
IPC—03 | International Plumbing Code ® ...101.2, 410.2, 503.3, 610.1,
- 810.1, 810.2, 810.3, 810.5, 1301.5

101.2, 403.2, 407.1.2,
507.2.1,

: 607.4.1, 607.4.3, 608.3, 703.2.1, 707.5.1, 707.6, 903.2, 903.3,
; 903.4, 904.1, 904.2, 1102.1, 1201.2.2, 1201.2.3

NBC—96 | BOCA National Building Code ~ .......................

® .

IRC—03. international Residential Code ~ .....
- ®




4-39 A REV. /77
STATE OF CONNECTICUT Page 36 of 55 pages

REGULATION

of

NAME OF AGENCY
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY

Concerning

SUBJECT MATTER OF REGULATIONS

STATE BUILDING CODE-2005 CONNECTICUT
SUPPLEMENT - 2009 AMENDMENT

AMENDMENTS TO THE 2003 INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE

Sec. 64. Sectwn 29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement, of
the 2003 lntematlonai Plumbing Code, is amended to add:

(NEW) CHAPTI’ER 10 - TRAPS, INTERCEPTORS AND SEPARATORS

(NEW) (Amd) 1003 3 Grease traps and grease interceptors. Grease traps and grease
interceptors ti"gat serve plumbing systems connected to private, on-site septic systems
shali comply vmth the requirements of Sections 1003.3.1 to 1003.3.4.2, inclusive. Grease
traps and grease interceptors that serve plumbing systems connected via a sanitary
sewer {0 a pubhcly owned treatment works shall comply with the Depariment of
Envaronmentai Protection’s General Permit for the Discharge of Wastewater Associated
with Food Preparat:on Establishments.

CHAPTER 13 REFERENCED STANDARDS

Sec. 65. Sectlon 29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement,
Chapter 13 of the 2003 International Plumbing Code, is amended fo add:

(NEW) (Amd International Code Council, Inc.
. 4051 West Flossmoor Road
ICC v Country Club Hills, IL 60478
Standard | ’ Referenced
reference | in code
number = | Title section number

IBC—03 ; International Building Code  .......... 201.3, 305.4, 307.1, 307.2,
o 307.3, 308.2, 309.1, 310.1, 310.3, 403.1,

Table 403.1, 404.1, 407.3, 417 6, 502.6,
606.5.2, 1106.5

ICCEC—03 | [CC Electricat Code ... ... 201.3, 502.1, 504.3, 1113.1.3

IEBC—03 | International Existing BuildingCode ... ... ... ... . oo
101.2
[ECC—08 | International Energy ConservationCode ... .. 313.1, 607.2,
: 607.2.1
IFC—03 internationalFireCode L. 201.3, 12011
IFGC—03 : International FuelGas Code ... L. 101.2, 201.3, 502.1
iMC—03 Internationai Mechanical  .......... 201.3, 307.6, 310.1, 422.9,
g Code 502.1, 812.1, 12021
IPSDC—03 International Private Sewage Disposal ....... ... ... ... .. ..
; Code 701.2
IRC—03: ; international Residential .. ... ... .. ... ... 101.2
: Code




4-38 A REV. 177
STATE OF CONNECTICUT Page 37 of 55 pages

REGULATION
| of
NAME OF AGENCY
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY

Concerning

SUBJECT MATTER OF REGULATIONS

STATE BUILDING CODE-2005 CONNECTICUT
SUPPLEMENT — 2009 AMENDMENT

AMENMENTS TO THE 2003 INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE

Sec. 66. Sectton 29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement,
Chapter 5 of the 2003 International Mechanical Code, is amended to add:
a

(NEW) CHAPTER 5 - EXHAUST SYSTEMS

(NEW) Add) ‘»10 1.1 Laboratories. For the purposes of the provisions of Section 510, a
laboratory shail be defined as a facility where the use of chemicals is related to testing,
analysis, teacﬁmg, research or developmental activities where chemicals are used or
synthesized op a non-production basis, rather than in a manufacturing process.

(NEW) (Amd)j 510.7 Suppression required. Ducts shall be protected with an approved
automatic ﬁre3 suppression system installed in accordance with the 2003 International
Building Code portion of the 2005 State Building Code as amended.
Excep;&zons
1. AnE ‘approved automatic fire suppression system shall not be required in ducts
- conveying materials, fumes, mists and vapors that are nonflammable and
5 nogncombustfble under all conditions and at any concentrations.
2. An approved automatic fire suppression system shall not be required in ducts
: where the largest cross-sectional diameter of the duct is less than 10 inches.
3. For laboratories, as defined in Section 510.1.1, automatic fire protection
syctems shall not be required in laboratory hoods or exhaust systems.

CHAPTER 13 REFERENCED STANDARDS

Sec. 67.: Section 29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement,
Chapter 15, e)f the 2003 International Plumbing Code, is amended to add:
T
(NEW) (Amd) International Code Council, Inc.
4051 West Flossmoor Road
lCC Country Club Hills, IL 60478

Standard Referenced

reference in code
number Tille section number

IBC—03 . international Building Code .. .201.3, 202, 301.12, 301.14, 301.15,
302.1, 302.2, 304.7, 304.10, 308.8,

308.10, 401.4, 401.6, 406.1, 502.10,
502.10.1, 504.2, 506.3.3, 506.3.10,
! 506.3.12.2, 506.4.1, 509.1, 510.6, 510.6.1,
510.6.2, 510.7, 511.1.5, 513.1, 513.2,

t 513.3, 513.4.3, 513.5, 513.5.2, 513.5.2.1,
! 513.6.2, 513.10.5, 513.12, 513.12.2,
513.20, 602.2.1.5.1, 602.2.1.5.2, 602.3,
603.1, 603.10, 604.5.4, 607.1.1, 607.3.2.1,
607.5.1, 607.5.2, 607.5.3, 607.5.4,
607.5.4.1, 607.5.5, 607.5.5.1, 607.86,
701.4.1, 701,4.2, 801.3, 801.16.1,
801.18.4, 902.1, 908.3, 908.4, 910.3,
925.1, 1004.6, 1105.1, 1206.4, 1402.4,
1402.4.1

IcC EC—03| ICC Electrical Code ... 201.3, 301.7, 306.3.1,
o 306.4.1, 513.11, 513.12.1, 602.2.1.1

|
JEBC—03 | International BExisting Building Code ... ... .. ... .. oL
i 101.2

{ECC—06 international Energy Conservation Code ... . ... 202, 301.2, 303.3,
3 312.1, 603.9, 604.1, 1204.1,




4-39 A REV. 1777 o
o STATE OF CONNECTICUT Page 38 of 55 pages

REGULATION
' of
NAME OF AGENCY
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY

: Concerning
' SUBJECT MATTER OF REGULATIONS

STATE BUILDING CODE-2005 CONNECTICUT
SUPPLEMENT — 2009 AMENDMENT

! 1204.2
IFC—03 !L Internationai Fire Code ... ... .. 201.3, 310.1, 311.1, 502.5,
502.7.2, 502.8.1, 502.9.5, 502.9.5.2,
502.9.5.3, 502.9.8.2, 502.8.8.3, 502.9.8.5,
502.9.8.8, 502.10, 502.10.3, 502.16.2, 509.1,
| 510.2.1, 510.2.2, 510.4, 513.12.3, 513.15,
E 513.16, 513.17, 513.18, 513.19, 513.20.2,
_ : 513.20.3,606.2.1, 808.7, 1101.9, 1105.3,
1106.5, 1106.6, 1301.1, 1301.2
IFGC—03; international Fuel Gas Code . ....... .. 101.2, 261.3, 301.3, 7011,
! 801.1, 901.1, 8061, 1101.5
IPC—03 | infernationai Plumbing Code  ........ .. 201.3, 301.8, 612.2, 908.5,
' 1002.1, 1002.2, 1002.3, 1005.2, 1006.6,
1008.2, 1009.3, 1101.4, 1201.1, 1206.2,
: 1206.3, 1401.2
IRC—03 = Internationai Residentad ... 101.2
'f | Code
i
i
[
I




4-39 A REV. 177 Ei

REGULATION

of

NAME OF AGENCY
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY

Concerning

SUBJECT MATTER OF REGULATIONS

STATE BUILDING CODE-2005 CONNECTICUT
SUPPLEMENT - 2009 AMENDMENT

Sec. 68. Sectig%n 29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement, 2003
International Ehergy Conservation Code, is amended fo add:

(NEW) (Del) 2003 INTERNATIONAL ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE: Delete
document in ltéo entirety and substitute with the 2006 International Energy Conservation
Code as amended herein:

(NEW) AMEN_S)MENTS TO THE 2006 INTERNATIONAL ENERGY CONSERVATION
CODE

il

(NEW) CHAPE‘;ER 1 — ADMINISTRATION

(NEW) (Amd) ;101 1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the 2006 International
Energy Conservation Code portion of the 2005 State Building Code, hereinafter referred
to as “the code or “this code”.

(NEW) (Amd) 101.5.2 Low energy buildings. The following buildings, or portions
thereof, sepai’ated from the remainder of the building by building thermal envelope
assemblies complylng with this code shall be exempt from the building thermal envelope
provisions of ?hES code:

1. Those with a peak design rate of energy usage less than 3.4 British thermal units
per h@ur per square foot (Btu/hft?) or 1.0 watts per square foot (watt/ft?) of floor
area fmr space conditioning purposes.

Those that do not contain conditioned space.

Buz!dmgs and structures for which heating and cooling is supplied solely by
utiilza‘;mﬂ of non-purchased renewable energy sources including, but not limited
to, on-site wind, on-site water or on-site solar power, or wood-burning heating
apphances that do not rely on backup heat from other purchased, non-renewable
sources

SR

(NEW) (Add) 101.7 Administrative matters not provided for. Administrative matters
not covered by this code shall be in accordance with the provisions of Chapter 1 of the
2003 Enterna}élonai Building Code portion of the 2005 State Building Code.

(NEW) (AmdE 104.1 General. Two sets of construction documents and other supporting
data shall be submitted to the building official at the time of application for the building
permit, The construction documents and designs submitted shall be prepared by a
registered d@sngn professional when required by the provisions of chapters 390 or 391 of
the Connect;cut General Statutes.

Except:on The building official may waive the submission of construction
documents and other supporting data not required to be prepared by a registered
demgn professional if the work proposed is not required by the provisions of this
code; or the building official determines that the nature of the work applied for is
such that review of the construction documents is not necessary to obtain
compliance with this code.

{(NEW) CHAPTER 2 - DEFINITIONS

i
(NEW) (Amd) 201.3 Terms defined in other codes. Where terms are not defined in
this code arfd are defined in other codes adopted as portions of the 2005 State Building
Code, such terms shall have the meanings ascribed to them as in those codes.

(NEW) §E(Adc§) 202.1 Definitions. Add or amend the following definitions:

STATE OF CONNECTICUT Page 39 of 55 pages



4-39 A REV. 1177
STATE OF CONNECTICUT Page 40 of 55 pages

REGULATION

of

NAME OF AGENCY
5 DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY

| Concerning

SUBJECT MATTER OF REGULATIONS

STATE BUILDING CODE-2005 CONNECTICUT
SUPPLEMENT — 2009 AMENDMENT

(NEW) (Add) i?UiLDiNG OFFICIAL. The officer or other designated authority charged
with the administration and enforcement of this code, or a duly authorized
representative; Also known as the local building official or code official.

{(NEW) (Add) { FULL CUTOFF LUMINAIRE. A luminaire that allows no direct light
emissions above a horizontal plane through the luminaire’s lowest light-emitting part.
(NEW) (Add) IGREENHOUSE. A one-story structure, enclosing a nonhabitable space,
with glazing in excess of 50 per cent of the gross area of the exterior walls and roof.

(NEW) (Amd) RESIDENTIAL BUILDING. For this code, includes detached one- and
two-family dweliings and townhouses as well as Group R-2, R-3 and R-4 buildings three
stories or less in height

.!

(NEW) (Amd)f SUNROOM. A one-story structure, enclosing a habitable space, with
glazing in excess of 40 per cent of the gross area of the exterior walls and roof, and with
the area of Wndows and doors operable to the exterior equal to a minimum of 20 per
cent of the area of the sunroom floor.

i

(NEW) cHAF?rER 4 - RESIDENTIAL ENERGY EFFICIENCY

(NEW) (Del) }402 2.10 Thermally isolated sunroom insulation. Delete in its entirety
and rep!ace wzth the following:

(NEW) (Add) 402 2.10 Urea-formaldehyde insulation. Pursuant to section 29-277 of
the Connect:cut General Statutes, urea-formaldehyde foamed-in-place insulation shall
not be mstal!ed in any building or structure on or after June 1, 1981.

&

(NEW) (Dei 402.3.5 Thermally isolated sunrcom U-factor. Delete without

l

substitution. ig
(NEW) (Add? 402.7 Prescriptive requirements for residential greenhouses and
sunrooms. |

Uncianditioned greenhouses and sunrooms that are freestanding or thermally
isolated fron? the conditioned space are exempt from the requirements of this code. As
an alternative to demonstrating compliance with other requirements of this code,
conditioned greenhouses and sunrooms shall meet the prescriptive envelope criteria in
Table 402.7) R-values refer to installed insulation only, not to assembly values. For
installed components with different R- or U- values, area-weighted averages shall be
used to determme compliance with Table 402.7.

Greenhouses that are freestanding or that are attached to the outside of the
building en\;'e!ope capable of being closed off from the dwelling through the use of
opaque walls and fixed or operable doors and windows shall be 400 square feet or less
in area and shalt have a maximum area-weighted fenestration U-value of 0.60.

Sunrooms that are free-standing or that are attached to the outside of the
building en\/e!ope capable of being closed off from the dwelling through the use of
opaque. wa!is and fixed or operable doors and windows shall be 500 square feet or less
in area and shall have a maximum area-weighted fenestration U-value of 0.50.
Sunrooms that are connected with a conditioned space via a permanent opening shall
be 350 SQJaI’e feet or less in area and shall have a maximum area-weighted
fenestration U-value of 0.45.




4-39 A REV. 177

(NEW) (Add)
greenhouses
Minimum bpac
Minimum floor
Minimum opag
Minimum slab
Minimum slab

(NEW) (Add) ¢
in Section 403

(NEW) (Add)
of Section 504

(NEW) CHAPE

STATE OF CONNECTICUT

REGULATION

of

NAME OF AGENGY
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY

Concerning
SUBJECT MATIER OF REGULATIONS

STATE BUILDING CODE-2005 CONNECTICUT
SUPPLEMENT - 2009 AMENDMENT

lable 402.7. Prescriptive envelope component criteria for residential
and sunrooms.

ue ceiling R-value R-19
'fover unheated space R-value R-19
ue wall R-value R-11
‘on-grade perimeter insulation R-value R-5
-on-grade perimeter insulation depth 2 feet

103.2.1.1 Duct insulation values. Minimum duct insuiation values stated
2.1 shall be installed R-values.

103.7 Swimming pools. Swimming pools shall comply with the provisions
7 of this code.

TER § — COMMERCIAL ENERGY EFFICIENCY

(NEW) (Add) 2?503.2,7.2 Duct insulation values. Minimum duct insulation values stated

in Section 50

.2.7 shall be installed R-values.

(NEW) (Amd)
accessible on-
setting. Pool §

504.7.1 Pool heaters. All pool heaters shall be equipped with a readily
-off switch to allow shutting off the heater without adjusting the thermostat

geaters fired by natural gas or liquefied petroleum gas (propane) shall not

have contmuc&us!y burning pilot lights.

(NEW) (Add)g;
supplied thrOJ
shall be full C.I

505.6.3 Light pollution controls. When the power for exterior lighting is
gh the energy service to the building, luminaires used for exterior lighting
toff luminaires.

Exceptlons

1. Luming
light o

2.

object;

alres with an output of 150 Watts incandescent or less, or the equivalent
utput

Luminaires intended to illuminate the fagade of buildings or to illuminate other
s including, but not limited to flagpoles, landscape and water features,

s*tatudry and works of art.

Luminaires for historic lighting on the premises of an historic building as defined

in the 12003 International Existing Building Code or within a designated historic

distnct

Low
Sign
Festc

Il
0

WoOoNOD O~

Outdoor sports facility lighting of the participant sport area.
Emergency exit discharge lighting.
ioltage landscape lighting.

umination.
n lighting as defined in the 2005 NFPA 70 National Electrical Code.

Temporary lighting for emergency, repair, construction, special events or similar

ac’ﬂv;ttes

i

Page 41 of 55 pages



4-38 A REV. 1177

REGULATION

of

NAME OF AGENCY
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY

Concerning

SUBJECT MATTER OF REGULATIONS

; STATE BUILDING CODE-2005 CONNECTICUT
SUPPLEMENT — 2009 AMENDMENT

!
;
:

i
;

AMEN?)MENTS TO THE 2003 INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE

CHAPTER 1 - ADMINISTRATION

Sec. 69. Section 29-252-1d, State Building Code —~ 2005 Connecticut Supplement,
Chapter 1, of the 2003 international Residential Code, is amended to add:

(NEW) (Amd)‘R1 01.2 Scope. The provisions of the 2003 International Residential Code
for One- and Two-Family Dwellings shall apply to the construction, alteration,
movement, ez’iiargement replacement, repair, equipment, use and occupancy, location,
removal and ;;iemohtzon of detached one- and two-family dwellings and multiple single-
family dweihngs (townhouses) not more than three stories in height with a separate
means of egr@ss and their accessory structures.
Excefxtlon Existing buildings undergoing repair, movement, alteration or
additions and change of occupancy shall be permitted to comply with the 2003
tntemationai Existing Building Code. The choice to comply with this code or the
2003 intemat;ona! Existing Building Code shall be made by the permit applicant
at the time of application for the building permit.

(NEW) (Add) R101.4.7 Demolition of structures. The demolition of structures shall be
conducted in accordance with the State Demolition Code as found in Chapter 541 of the
Connecticut :enera! Statutes.

(NEW) (Amrl) R105.1 Required. Any owner or authorized agent who intends to
construct, erlarge alter, repair, move, demolish or change the occupancy of a building
or sfructure, :for to move a lot line that will affect any existing building or structure, or to
erect, instail;f enlarge, alter, repair, remove, convert or replace any electrical, gas,
mechanical or plumbing system, the installation of which is regulated by this code, or to
cause any si.kch work to be done, shall first make application to the building official and
obtain the requnred permit.

(NEW) (Add) R109.1.5.2 Additional electrical inspections. Required electrical
inspections | ln addition to those required by Sections R109.1.2 and R 109.1.6 shall
include mstallatlons of temporary services prior fo activation and installation of
undergroun& piping and conductors after trenches are excavated and bedded and
before backf i!l is put in place.
(NEW) (Add) SECTION R117 — VACANT BUILDINGS

(NEW) (Adct) R117.1 General. Temporarily unoccupied buildings, structures, premises
or portions thereof, including tenant spaces, shall be safeguarded and maintained in
accordanceﬁweth Section 117 of the 2003 International Building Code portion of the 2005
State Buiidr‘lg Code.

CHAPTER 2 DEFINITIONS
Sec. 70 Se,chon 29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement,

Chapter 2, Section R202.1, of the 2003 International Residential Code, is amended as
follows:

STATE OF CONNECTICUT Page 42 of 55 pages



4-39 A REV. 1777 ]
5 STATE OF CONNECTICUT Page 43 of 55 pages
REGULATION
of

NAME OF AGENGY
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY

Concerning
SUBJECT MATTER OF REGULATIONS

STATE BUILDING CODE-2005 CONNECTICUT
SUPPLEMENT — 2009 AMENDMENT

(Add) R202.1 Definitions. Add or [Amend] amend the following definitions:

: [

(Amd) BU!LEING EXISTING. An existing building is a building or structure, or portion
thereof, erected in whole or in part, for which a legal building permit and a certificate of
ocecupancy has been issued. Buildings or structures or portions thereof erected prior to
October 1, 1970 shall be deemed existing buildings regardiess of the existence of a legal
permit or a certificate of occupancy.

(Add) COMF‘? EX. For application of accessibility requirements, this term means any
group of buildings located on a single parcel of land or on contiguous parcels of land or
any building or group of buildings that are subdivided into separate occupancies and
planned, finaniced, constructed or promoted by common management for the purpose of
sale or lease of the entire complex or any subdivision thereof, excluding any single-
family detached dwelling.

(Add) ON__E-F‘EAMILY DWELLING. A building containing one dweilling unit with not more
than six lodaers or boarders where care is not provided. Also known as a single-family

dw eEilng

{Add) TWO FA’MILY DWELLING. A building containing two dwelling units with not more
than six iodqers or boarders per dwelling unit where care is not provided.

(Amd) WENEP BORNE DEBRIS REGION. Areas where the basic wind speed in
accordance Wl’th Appendix M is equal to or greater than 120 miles per hour.

.‘a
1

CHAPTER 3~ BUILDING PLANNING

Sec. 71. Se étion 29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement,
Chapter 3, of the 2003 international Residential Code, is amended fo add:

(NEW) (Amd) R301.2.1.2 Internal pressure. Windows in buildings located in windborne
debris regiops shall have glazed openings protected from windborne debris or the
building shall be designed as a partially enclosed building in accordance with the 2003
internatlona! i Building Code portion of the 2005 State Building Code. Glazed opening
protection for windborne debris shall meet the requirements of the Large Missile Test of
ASTM E199€5 and of ASTM E 1886 referenced herein.
Exceptlon Wood structural panels with a minimum thickness of 7/16 inch and a
maximum span of 8 feet shall be permitted for opening protection in one- and
twoustory buildings and for the first and second story of three-story buildings.
Panels shall be precut and marked for location to cover the glazed openings with
attachment hardware provided. Attachments shall be provided in accordance
with ‘Tabie R301.2.1.2 or shall be designhed to resist the components and
cladding loads determined in accordance with the provisions of the 2003
lntematlonal Building Code portion of the 2005 State Building Code.

Sec. 72 Sect;on 29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement,
Chapter 3, Sectlon R305.1, of the 2003 iInternational Residential Code, is amended as
foi!aws ’

(Amd) R30£§1 Minimum height. Habitable rooms, hallways, corridors, bathrooms, toilet
rooms, laurxdry rooms and basements shall have a ceiling height of not less than 7 feet.
The required height shall be measured from the finished floor to the lowest projection
from the celling.

Exc =ptlons:




4-38 A REV. 177

STATE OF CONNECTICUT

REGULATION

of

Page 44 of 55 pages

NAME OF AGENCY
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY

Concerning

SUBJECT MATTER OF REGULATIONS

STATE BUILDING CODE-2005 CONNECTICUT
SUPPLEMENT - 2009 AMENDMENT

. Beams! girders, pipes, ducts or other obstructions spaced not less than 4 feet on

center shall be permitted to project not more than 6 inches below the required
ceiling hesght

Basements without habitable spaces shall have a ceiling height of not less than 6
feet, 8 inches. Beams, girders, pipes, ducts or other obstructions shall be
permitted to project not more than 4 inches below the required ceiling height.

Not more than 50 per cent of the required area of a habitable room or space is
permitted to have a sloped or furred ceiling less than 7 feet in height. No portion
of the required floor area shall be less than 5 feet in height.

. Bathrobms are permitied to have sloped or furred ceilings, but shall have a

m;nlme ceiling height of 6 feet, 8 inches over the fixtures and at the front
clearance area for the fixtures as shown in Figure R307.2. A shower or tub
equspped with a showerhead shall have a minimum ceiling height of 6 feet, 8
mches‘ above a minimum area 30 inches by 30 inches at the showerhead.

Cemn( height in existing basements being converted to habitable space shall be
not Eess than 6 feet, 10 inches clear except under beams, girders, pipes, ducts or
other obstructlons where the clear height shall be a minimum of 6 feet, [6] 4
|nche?

Sec. 73. Secé,ion 29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement,

Chapter 3, of

(NEW) (Add)
dwellings on
required by
perpendicula

the 2003 International Residential Code, is amended to add:

R309.2.1 Detached garages. Detached garages shall be separated from
the same lot as required by Section R309.2 with opening protection as
Section 309.1. This provision shall not apply to garage walls that are
r to the adjacent dwelling unit wall.

Exception: Detached garages that are separated from the dwelling by a

minim

Sec. 74. Se

um distance of 10 feet.

étion 29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement,

Chapter 3, Séction R310.1, of the 2003 International Residential Code, is amended as

follows: 4

(Amd) R310.
located withi

|
|

a Emergency escape and rescue openings required. Habitable spaces
1 basements and every sleeping room within the dwelling shall have at least

one operable emergency escape and rescue opening. Where basements contain one
or more slee;pmg rooms, emergency egress and rescue openings shall be required in
each sleeping room, but shall not be required in adjoining habitable areas of the

basement.
have a sill helght of not more than 44 inches above the floor.

Where emergency escape and rescue openings are provided, they shall
Where a door opening

having a thr@shoid below the adjacent ground elevation serves as an emergency escape
and rescue openmg and is provided with a bulkhead enclosure, the bulkhead enclosure
shall compfy with Section R310.3. Emergency escape and rescue openings with a
finished sill hetght below the adjacent ground elevation shall be provided with a window
well in accordance with Section R310.2.

Exc@ptaons

Hab;table basements without sleeping rooms are not required to have
emefifgency escape and rescue openings when they are provided with two
rem@te, code-compliant stairways.

In existing buildings, basements being converted to habitable space without
siee%)ing rooms are not required to have emergency escape and rescue
openings.

The 44-inch maximum sill height shall be permifted to be measured vertically
above a fixed, permanent platform, step or steps whose minimum width shall
equal or exceed the operable width of the opening and shall be centered on




4-39 A REV. 177
STATE OF CONNECTICUT

REGULATION

of

Page 45 of 55 pages

NAME OF AGENCY
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY

Conceming
SUBJECT MATTER OF REGULATIONS

STATE BUILDING CODE-2005 CONNECTICUT
SUPPLEMENT — 2009 AMENDMENT

sﬁch Q%peninq and which shall comply with Sections R311.5.3.1 and R311.5.3.2.
Giazw}_un windows complying with this exception shall not be subiect to the
Qrovssmns of Section R308.4, item 10.

Sec. 75. Secti
Chapter 3, of

;|on 28-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement,
;he 2003 International Residential Code, is amended to add:

(NEW) (Add) R312.1 Retaining wall guards. Retaining walls with a difference in
finished grade from the top of the wall to the bottom of the wall that is greater than 4 feet
shall be prov;ded with guards complying with Section R312 when there is a walking
surface, parkmg lot or driveway on the high side located closer than 2 feet to the
retaining walt For the purposes of this section, grass, planting beds or landscaped
areas shall nct he considered a walking surface.

(NEW) (Amd)
entry is made’
by 1 1/z-lnch-i
partic!eboard

R314.2.3 Attics and crawlspaces. Within attics and crawlspaces where
only for service of utilities, foam plastics shall be protected against ignition

hick mineral fiber insulation, %-inch-thick wood structural panels, 3/8-inch

Ya-inch hardboard, 3/8-inch gypsum board or corrosion-resistant steel

having a bas;e metal thickness of 0.016 inch. The ignition barrier is not required where
the foam plastic insulation has been tested in accordance with Section R314.3.

(NEW) (Amd R314.3 Specific approval. Foam plastic not meeting the requirements of
Sections R314 1 and R314.2 may be specifically approved on the basis of one of the
following approved tests: FM 4880, UL 1040, NFPA 286 with the acceptance criteria of
Section R315 4, or UL 1715, or fire tests related to actual end-use configurations. The
specific apprfoval shall be based on the actual end-use configuration and shall be
performed ofﬁ the finished foam plastic assembly in the maximum thickness intended for
use. Assemblfes tested shall include seams, joints and other typical details used in the
installation of the assembly and shall be tested in the manner intended for use.
i

(NEW) (Amd) R317.1 Two-family dwellings. Dwelling units in two-family dwellings shall
be separated from each other and from common spaces serving both dwelling units by
wall or onor—celtang assemblies having not less than a 1-hour fire-resistance rating when
tested in accordance with ASTM E 119. Fire-resistance-rated floor-ceiling and wall
assemblies shail extend to and be tight against the exterior wall and wall assemblies
shall extend to the underside of the roof sheathing. Fire-resistance-rated assemblies
shall be supported to the foundation by construction with the same fire-resistance rating
as the assembiy supported.

Exceptson A fire-resistance rating of %2 hour shall be permitted in buildings

equ;pped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance

with NFPA 13.

(NEW) SEC
with:

(NEW) (Adc

(NEW) (Add

T ION R322 ~ ACCESSIBILITY. Delete section in its entirety and replace

) R322 ~ ACCESSIBILITY

} R322.1 Scope. Detached one- and two-family dwellings shall be exempt

from acces*

Ibllity requirements. Attached multiple single-family dwellings (townhouses)

shall comply with Section R322.2 for single-story townhouses and with Section R322.3
for multi- story townhouses. For the purposes of this section, a one-story above-grade
dwelling wsth a finished basement shall be considered a multi-story townhouse.
Required T} pe B units shall comply with ICC/ANS! A117.1-2003, as amended.




4-35 A REV. 1/77
STATE OF CONNECTICUT Page 46 of 55 pages

REGULATION

of

NAME OF AGENCY
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY

Concerning
SUBJECT MATTER OF REGULATIONS

STATE BUILDING CODE-2005 CONNECTICUT
SUPPLEMENT — 2009 AMENDMENT

-

(NEW) (Ac:tcl)ii R322.2 Single-story townhouses. Where there are four or more
townhouses i m a single structure, each single-story townhouse shall be a Type B unit.

Excep‘taon The number of Type B units shall be permitted to be reduced in

accorci}ance with Section R322.4.

2

{NEW) (Add)zR322 3 Multi-story townhouses. Buildings or complexes that contain 10
or more mui’gkstory townhouses shall have at least 10 per cent Type B units. This
requirement shall be met by providing a sufficient number of single-story Type B units or
by providing a sufficient number of multi-story townhouses that incorporate a Type B unit
on the street floor or by a combination of the two. Mulii-story townhouses that
incorporate aéﬂ' ype B unit on the street floor shail not be required to provide accessibility
to floors above or below the street floor. The Type B unit on the street floor shall include
provisions foz livmg, sleeping, eating, cooking and a complete toilet and bathing facility
on that floor. |

Excej 'tions

1. Structures with fewer than four dwelling units.
2. The nhmber of Type B units shall be permitted to be reduced in accordance with

Sectldn R322.4.
[
{(NEW) (Add)'g_ R322.4 General exceptions. Where permitted by Sections R322.2 and
R322.3, the required number of Type B units shall be permitted to be reduced in
accordance \ﬁ’ith Sections R322.4.1 and R322.4.2.

(NEW) (Add) R322 4.1 Site impracticality. On a site with multiple buildings, the number
of unifs requtred by Sections R322.2 and R322.3 to be Type B units shall be permitted
to be reduce§d to a percentage which is equal to the percentage of the entire site having
grades, pi’iOE to development, which are less than 10 per cent, provided that not less
than 20 per cent of the Type B units required by Sections R322.2 and R322.3 on the site
are prov:ded

3

(NEW) (Add) R322.4.2 Design flood elevation. The required number of Type B units
shall not apﬁly to a site where the lowest floor is required to be at or above the design
flood eievation resulting in:
1. A difference in elevation between the minimum required floor elevation at the
prlmary entrance and the closest vehicular and pedestrian arrival points, and
2. A siope exceeding 10 per cent between the minimum required floor elevation at
f.he pnmary entrance and the closest vehicular and pedestrian arrival points.

(NEW) -(Adc) R322.5 Accessible route. At least one accessible route shall connect
accessible E:uddmg or facility entrances with the primary entrance of each Type B unit
within the bujilding or complex and with those exterior and interior facilities that serve the
units., |
Exce}ption: If the slope of the finished ground level between accessible facilities
and 'buildings exceeds one unit vertical in 12 units horizontal (1:12), or where
physical barriers prevent the installation of an accessible route, a vehicular route
with ‘parkmg that complies with Section 1106 of the 2003 International Building
Codé portion of the 2005 State Building Code at each public or common use
faCIE "ty or building is permitted in place of the accessible route.
i
(NEW): (Add) R322.6 Parking. Two per cent, but not less than one, of each type of
parking space provided in occupancies which are required to have Type B dwelling units
shall be accesssbie For each six or fraction of six accessible parking spaces, at least
one shall be a van-accessible parking space.




439 A REV. 177

STATE OF CONNECTICUT

REGULATION

of

NAME OF AGENCY
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY

Concerning
SUBJECT MATTER OF REGULATIONS

STATE BUILDING CODE-2005 CONNECTICUT
SUPPLEMENT - 2009 AMENDMENT

(NEW) (Add)ig R322.6.1 Parking within or beneath a building. Where parking is
provided within or beneath a building, accessible parking spaces shall also be provided
within or beneath the building.
Exce;@tlon Private parking garages within or beneath the building that contain
no me re than two parking spaces, that are reserved for the exclusive use of a
spec;fc dwelling unit and are direclly accessed from that dwelling unit are not
requzr@d {o be accessible.

(NEW) (Add) R322.6.2 Automobile accessible parking spaces. Pursuant to
subsection (h) of section 14-253a of the Connecticut General Statutes, parking spaces
for passenger motor vehicles designated for the handicapped shall be as near as
possible to ag building entrance or walkway and shall be 15 feet wide including 5 feet of
cross hatch ,ross—hatched portions shall not be shared between spaces.

{(NEW) (Add} R322.6.3 Van accessible parking spaces. Pursuant to subsection (h)
of section 14-253&1 of the Connecticut General Stafutes, parking spaces for passenger
vans desxgnated for the handicapped shall be as near as possible to a building entrance
or walkway and shall be 16 feet wide including 8 feet of cross hatch. Cross-hatched
portions sha!l not be shared between spaces.

(NEW) (Add)% R322.6.3.1 Van access clearance. Pursuant {o subsection (i) of section
14-253a of the Connecticut General Statutes, each public parking garage or terminal
shall have 8 ieet 2 inches vertical clearance at a primary entrance and along the route to
at least two parking spaces for passenger vans that conform to Section R322.6.3 and
that have 8 f’het 2 inches of vertical clearance.

(NEW) (Add) R322.7 Recreational facilities. In townhouse occupancies where
recreational facilities are provided, 25 per cent, but not less than one of each type of
recreational facility serving the complex, shall be accessible in accordance with Chapter
11 of the 20(:;2}3 International Building Code portion of the 2005 State Building Code.

(NEW) (Add R322.8 Accessible common spaces. Rooms and spaces available to the
general’ pubilc or common spaces available for use by residents and serving Type B
units shall be accessible in accordance with Chapter 11 of the 2003 International
Building Code portion of the 2005 State Building Code. Accessible common spaces

Page 47 of 55 pages

shall mciude
pools, loung
balconies. ;

Exce,

CHAPTER 4

but not be limited to, laundry facilities, toilet and bathing rooms, swimming
as, assembly spaces and any exterior spaces, including patios, terraces and

ption: Recreational facilities in accordance with Section R322.7.

- FOUNDATIONS

Sec. 76. Se

] EC’GOI’I 29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement,
Chapter 4, ¢

f the 2003 International Residential Code, is amended {o add:

(NEW) (Amd) R403.1 General. All exterior walls shall be supported on continuous solid
or fully groijted masonry or concrete footings, wood foundations or other approved
structural systems which shall be of sufficient design to accommodate all loads
according to Section R301 and to transmit the resulting loads to the soil within the
limitations as determined from the character of the soil.
Exceptson Freestanding accessory structures with an area of 600 square feet
or iess and an eave height of 10 feet or less.
Footmgs and freestanding accessory structures as exempted above shail be
supported on undisturbed natural soils or engineered fill,




4-30 A REV. 177

STATE OF CONNECTICUT

REGULATION

of

Page 48 of 55 pages

NAME OF AGENCY
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY

Concerning
SUBJECT MATTER OF REGULATIONS

STATE BUILDING CODE-2005 CONNECTICUT
SUPPLEMENT - 2009 AMENDMENT

(NEW) (Amd) R403.1.41 Frost protection. Except where otherwise protected from
frost, foundagton walls, piers and other permanent supports of buildings and structures
shall be protected from frost by one or more of the following methods:

._h

. Extending a minimum of 42 inches below finished grade;

Constructmg in accordance with Section R403.3;

Constructang in accordance with ASCE 32-01; and

Erect;ng on solid rock.

Exceptions

1. Freestandmg accessory structures with an area of 600 square feet or less
and an eave height of 10 feet or less shall not be required to be protected.

2. Decks not supported by a dwelling need not be provided with footings that
extend below the frost fine.

Footings shall not bear on frozen soil.

(NEW) (Addf

R405.3 Above grade drainage. Above grade drainage systems, including

but not limited to gutters and downspouts, roof drains, yard drains, etc. shall not be

connected to

the foundation drainage system of concrete, masonry or wood foundations.

Sec. 77. Seétion 29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement,

Chapter 8, of

CHAPTER 8

the 2003 International Residential Code, is amended as follows:

- ROOF-CEILING [ASSEMBLIES] CONSTRUCTION

Sec, 78. Se:}tion 29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement,

Chapteri 8, of

(NEW) (Add

the 2003 International Residential Code, is amended to add:

) R806.4 Conditioned attic assemblies. Unvented conditioned attic

assemblies (spaces between the ceiling joists of the top story and the roof rafters) are

permitted wh

en conditions 1 through 3 are met. Such attics shall not be required to be

provided with a conditioned air supply or a source of heat.

. No interior vapor retarders are installed on the ceiling side (attic floor) of the

unve nted attic assembly.

. An air-tmpermeabie insulation is applied in direct contact to the underside/interior

of thga structural roof deck. “Air-impermeable” shall be defined by ASTM E 283-
04. |

. Sufflclent insulation is installed to maintain the monthly average temperature of

the condensmg surface above 45 degrees F (7 degrees C). The condensing
surface is defined as either the structural roof deck or the interior surface of an
air-irr permeable insulation applied in direct contact with the underside/interior of
the *tructural roof deck. “Air-impermeable” shall be defined by ASTM E 283-04.
For (‘*alculation purpeoses, an interior temperature of 68 degrees F (20 degrees C)
is asSumed The exterior temperature is assumed to be the monthly average
outsme temperature.

CHAPTER ’H — ENERGY EFFICIENCY

Sec. ?9 Se,ctlon 29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Conneclicut Supplement,
Chapter 11f,of the 2003 International Residential Code, is amended fo add:

i

(NEW)F(An“ d) N1101.2.1 Detached one- and two-family dwellings. Compliance shall
be demonst rated by either:

. ;Meetlng the requirements of this chapter for buildings with a glazing area that
:does not exceed 15 per cent of the gross area of those exterior walls that
_comprise a portion of the thermal envelope; or

. Me(ntmg the requirements of the 2006 International Energy Conservation Code.




4-38 A REV.1/77

(NEW) (Amd)
Meetil

1.
does

comp
2. Meeti

(NEW) (Add)

STATE OF CONNECTICUT
REGULATION

of

NAME OF AGENCY
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY

Concerning
SUBJECT MATTER OF REGULATIONS

STATE BUILDING CODE-2005 CONNECTICUT
SUPPLEMENT — 2009 AMENDMENT

N1101.2.2 Townhouses. Compliance shall be demonstrated by either:

g the requirements of this chapter for buildings with a glazing area that
not exceed 25 per cent of the gross area of those exterior walls that
rise a portion of the thermal envelope; or

g the requirements of the 2006 International Energy Conservation Code.

N1105 SECTION N1105 — SWIMMING POOLS

Page 49 of 55 pages

(NEW) (Add) N1105.1 Swimming pools. Swimming poois shall be equipped with
energy savmg measures in accordance with Section 504.7 of the 2006 international

Energy Conservat!on Code portion of the 2005 State Building Code.

Sec. 80. Sec tion 29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement, the
2003 Enternationai Residential Code, is amended to add:

(NEW) CHAIj’TER 17 - COMBUSTION AIR
i

(NEW) (Add)SM1703 6 Mechanical combustion air supply. Mechanical combustion air
supply systems shall comply with manufacturer's installation instructions for both the

fuel-burning

app!aance and the combustion air supply system.

CHAPTER 24 FUEL GAS

Sec. 81. J Se:,
of the 2003 International Residential Code, is amended to add:

Chapter 24,

tion 29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement,

(NEW) (Addi G2411.1.1 Corrugated stainless steel tubing (CSST). CSST gas piping

shall be bon

(NEW) (Amg
a circulating
elevator she
through any

unit served [

Sec. 82. Se

2003 Interna

(NEW) CHA

2

:ied in accordance with manufacturer’'s installation instructions.

) G2415.1 Prohibited locations. Piping shall not be installed in or through
air duct, clothes chute, chimney or gas vent, ventilating duct, dumbwaiter or
ft. Piping installed downstream of the point of delivery shall not extend
townhouse unit, including basements and underfloor spaces, other than the
v such piping.

ction 29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement, the
tional Residential Code, is amended to add:

EPTER 29 — WATER SUPPLY AND DISTRIBUTION

(NEW) (A

\

1) P2904.9.1.3 PVC plastic pipe. A purple primer complying with ASTM F

656-96a sh"sll be applied to all PVC solvent cemented joints. Solvent cement that is not

purple in cog

or for PVC plastic pipe conforming to ASTM D 2564-96a shall be applied to

all joint surfaces

Sec. 83. Ss
2003 Intema

i

(NEW) CHA

(NEW) (Add
shall comply

ction 29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement, the

itional Residential Code, is amended to add:

\PTER 30 — SANITARY DRAINAGE

) P3006.3.6.1 PVC plastic pipe joints. Joints in PVC plastic DWV piping
with Section P2904.9.1.3 of this code.



4-39 A REV. 1/77
STATE OF CONNECTICUT Page 50 of 55 pages

REGULATION

of

NAME OF AGENCY
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY

Concerning
SUBJECT MATIER OF REGULATIONS

STATE BUILDING CODE-2005 CONNECTICUT
SUPPLEMENT - 2009 AMENDMENT

Sec. 84. Sec’tlon 29-252-1d, State Building Code ~ 2005 Connecticut Supplement, the
2003 Intefrnaf jonal Resadentzal Code, is amended to add:

(NEW) CHAF’TER 35 - SERVICES

(NEW) (Add) E3509.7.1 Corrugated stainless steel tubing (CSST). CSST gas piping
shall be bonc%ed in accordance with manufacturer's installation instructions.

CHAPTER 33 ~ POWER AND LIGHTING DISTRIBUTION

Sec. 85. Seétion 29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement,
Chapter 38, E)f the 2003 International Residential Code, is amended as follows:

(Amd) E3802 11 Bedroom outlets. All branch circuits that supply 125-volt, single-

phase, 15- and 20-ampere outlets installed in dwelling unit bedrooms shall be protected

by an arc-fadlt circuit interrupter listed to provide protection of the entire branch circuit.
{Exce“ptlon Smoke detectors shall be permitted to be supplied by branch circuits
witholt such protection providing such branch circuits supply no other outlets
WIth!fE the dwelling unit bedroom.]

CHAPTER 43 - REFERENCED STANDARDS

Sec. 86. Se{}tion 29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement,
Chapter 43, of the 2003 International Residential Code, is amended to add:

(NEW) (Amd)  International Code Gouncil

: 4051 W. Flossmoor Rd.
lCC Country Club Hills, 11 60478
Standard | Referenced
reference | in code
number: v Title section number
iIBC—03 ! International Building ... R110.2, R322.1, R323.1, R323.1.5,
' Code R403.1.8, R1001.8.2, G2402.3
ICC EC—03 ICC Electrical Code—Administrative ..., .. R107.3, G2402.3
Provisions

I[EBC—03 International Existing BuildingCode . ... oo
R101.2, G2401.1
IECC—06 International Energy ConservationCode ... .. . ... ... L.
.R104.11
IFC—03 international FireCode oL R102.7,
G2402.3, G2412.2, G2423 1
[FGC—03 International Fuel GasCode L Lo
R104.11, G2401.1
IMC—0Q3 international MechanicalCode Lo
» R104.11, M2106.1, G2402.3
IPC—03 International PlumbingCode L Lo
. R104.11, G2402.3
[PSDC—03 international Private Sewage Disposal .. ... . o L.
: Code R323.16
IPMC—03 international Property Maintenance Code .. ... ... L L
: R102.7
SBCCl SSTD 10- Standard for Hurricane Resistant .. . oL
99 i Construction R301.2.1.1

APPENDIX E - MANUFACTURED HOUSING USED AS DWELLINGS




439 A REV.1/77
STATE OF CONNECTICUT Page 51 of 55 pages

REGULATION

of

NAME OF AGENCY
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY

Concerning
SUBJECT MATTER OF REGULATIONS

STATE BUILDING CODE-2005 CONNECTICUT
SUPPLEMENT - 2009 AMENDMENT

Sec. 87. Seotton 29-252-1d, State Building Code ~ 2005 Connecticut Supplement,
Append;x E, ef the 2003 International Residential Code, is amended as follows:

[(Deh] (Add} SECTION AE600 —~ SPECIAL REQUIREMENTS FOR FOUNDATION
SYSTEMS [Delete Section AES0O without substitution.]

Sec. 88. Sec{t!on 29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement,
Appendix E, of the 2003 International Residential Code, is amended to add:

{(NEW) (Add} AE600.1 General. The provisions of Sections AEB01 through AEGQ06 are
applicable oniy upon request of the building permit applicant with the approval of the
focal bu;ldmg official.

APPENDIX G — SWIMMING POOLS, SPAS AND HOT TUBS

Sec. 89. Segction 29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement,
Appendix G, of the 2003 International Residential Code, is amended to add:

(NEWW) (Addi AG102.1.1 Definitions. Amend the following definition to read as follows:

(NEW) Resudent;al That which is situated on the premises of a detached one- or two-
family dwelli ng or which is accessory to an individual one-family townhouse for the
exclusive use of its residents and invited guests.

(NEW) (Amd) AG106.2 Suction fittings. All pool and spa suction outlets shall be
provided wzth a cover that conforms with ASME/ANSI A112.19.8M-2007 or an approved
channel dram system.

Exce‘ptlon Surface skimmers.

(NEW) (Add) AG106.2.1 Fitting maintenance. Any pool, spa or hot tub with a broken,
loose or mﬁssmg suction outiet cover shall be immediately placed out of service until
repairs are (;ompieted and approved.

(NEW) (Amd) AG106.3 Atmospheric vacuum relief system required. All pool and spa
single or muitipfe outlet circulation systems other than poois equipped only with surface
skimmers <§_haii be equipped with atmospheric vacuum relief. Such vacuum relief
systems shét! include at least one approved or engineered method of the type specified
herein, as f@llows

1. Bafety vacuum release system conforming to ASME A112.19.17, or

2. An approved gravity drainage system operating through a surge tank

(NEW) (Amd) AG106.4 Dual drain separation. Single or multiple pump circulation
systems shall be provided with a minimum of two (2) suction outlets of the approved
type. A m;r‘ilmum horizontal or vertical distance of three (3) feet shall separate such
outlets. Thfs separation distance shall be measured from near point of opening to near
point of opemng These suction outlets shall be piped so that water is drawn through
them simultaneously, distributed as evenly as possible, through a vacuum relief
protected Ime to the pump or pumps.

(NEW)i (An’id) AG108.1 General. Amend the following standard:

(NE\N) (Amd) ANSIHASME A112.19.8 2007 Suction Fittings for Use in Swimming Pools,
Wadmg Pomls Spasand Hot TUbS ... AG 108.2




4-39 A REV. 1/77
STATE OF CONNECTICUT Page 52 of 55 pages

REGULATION

of

NAME OF AGENCY
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY

Concerning
SUBJECT MATTER COF REGULATIONS

STATE BUILDING CODE-2005 CONNECTICUT
SUPPLEMENT - 2009 AMENDMENT

AMENDMENTS TO THE 2005 NFPA 70 NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE

Sec. 90. Se Jtzon 29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Connecticut Supplement,
Section 210. 12 of the 2005 NFPA 70 National Electrical Code, is amended as follows:

{Amd) 21 0.14;2 Arc-fault circuit-interrupter protection.

(Amd) (B) Dwelling unit bedrooms. All 120-volt, single-phase, 15- and 20-ampere
branch circuits supplying outlets installed in dwelling unit bedrooms shall be protected by
an arc-fault gircuit interrupter, listed to provide protection of the entire branch circuit.
Exception[1]: The location of the arc-fault circuit interrupter shall be permitted to
be at other than the origination of the branch circuit in compliance with (a) and
{b):
(a) The arc-fault circuit interrupter installed within 6 feet of the branch circuit
overcurrent device as measured along the branch circuit conductors.

(b) The circuit conductors between the branch circuit overcurrent device and the
arc-fault circuit interrupter shall be installed in a metal raceway or a cable with
~ametallic sheath.

[Exciéption 2: Smoke detectors shall be permitted to be supplied by branch
czrcutts without such protection providing such branch circuits supply no other
outleis within the dwelling unit bedroom ]

Sec. 91, Se¢ ct;on 29-252-1d, State Building Code — 2005 Conneclicut Supplement, of
the 2005 NFPA 70 National Electrical Code, is amended to add:

(NEW) ;(Adc”) 250.104 (B) (1) Corrugated stainless steel tubing (CSST). CSST gas
piping shall be bonded in accordance with manufacturer’s installation instructions.

(NEW) (Add) 300.4 (G) Cables and raceways installed under roof decking. A cable-

or raceway-type wiring method, installed in exposed or concealed locations under metal-

corrugated sheet roof decking, shall be installed and supported so the nearest outside

surface of the cable or raceway is not less than 1 % inch from the nearest surface of the

roof decking.
Exception: Rigid metal conduit and intermediate metal conduit shall not be
required to comply with 300.4(G).

(NEW) (Amd) 422.16 (B} (2) Built-in dishwashers and trash compactors. Built-in
dlshwashen and trash compactors shall be permitied to be cord-and-plug connected
with a fiexd::le cord identified as suitable for the purpose in the installation instructions of
the appilang;e manufacturer where all of the following conditions are met.

(1) The flexible cord shall be terminated with a grounding-type attachment plug.
Exceptlon A listed dishwasher or frash compactor distinctly marked to identify it
as ﬁrotected by a system of double insulation, or its equivalent, shall not be
rqusisred to be terminated with a groundmg-type attachment piug

(2) The Eength of the cord shall be (3 ft minimum fo 4 ft maximum in length) measured

from the fage of the attachment plug to the plane of the rear of the appliance.

(3) Receptacles shall be located to avoid physical damage to the flexible cord.

(4) The receptac]e shall be located in the space occupied by the appliance or adjacent

thereto. |

(5) The rec;éptacie shall be readily accessible without removing the appliance.

(NEW) (Amd) 680.26 Equipotential bonding.




4-39A REV. W77

STATE OF CONNECTICUT

REGULATION

of

NAME OF AGENCY
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY

Concerning

SUBJECT MATTER OF REGULATIONS

STATE BUILDING CODE-2005 CONNECTICUT
SUPPLEMENT — 2009 AMENDMENT

;E

(NEW) (Amd) (C) Equipotential bonding grid. The parts specified in 680.26 (B) shall

be connecte
covered, or
identified co
welding or by
the purpose ;

d to an equipotential bonding grid with a solid copper conductor, insulated,
bare not smaller than 8 AWG or rigid metal conduit or brass or other
rrosion-resistant metal conduit. Connection shall be made by exothermic
y listed pressure connectors or clamps that are labeled as being suitable for
and are of stainless steel, brass, copper, or copper alloy. The equipotential

bonding grid shall conform to the contours of the pool and shall extend within or under
paved walking surfaces for 3 feet horizontally beyond the inside walls of the pool and
shall be permitted to be any of the following:

Page 53 of 55 pages

Excegpﬂon The equipotential bonding grid shall not be required to be installed
under the bottom of or vertically along the walls of vinyl lined polymer wall,
fibergiass composite or other pools constructed of nonconductive materials. Any
metal parts of the pool, including metal structural supports, shall be bonded in
accordance with 680.26 (B). For the purposes of this section, poured concrete,
pneumaticaily applied (sprayed) concrete and concrete block, with painted or
piastered coatings, shall be considered conductive material.
(1) Structural Reinforcing Steel. The structural reinforcing steel of a concrete pool or
deck where| ‘the reinforcing rods are bonded together by the usual steel tie wires or the
equivalent. Where deck reinforcing steel is not an integral part of the pool, the deck
reinforcing steel shall be bonded to other parts of the bonding grid using a minimum 8
AWG solid copper conductor. Connection shall be per 680.26 (D).
(2) Bolted ozy\NeEded Metal Pools. The wall of a bolted or welded metal pool.
(3) Alternate Means. This system shall be permitted to be constructed as specified in (a)
through (c): |
(a.) Mater;als and Connections. The grid shall be constructed of minimum 8 AWG
bare solid copper conductors. Conductors shall be bonded to each other at all
pomis of crossing. Connections shall be made as required by 680.26 (D).
(b.) Grld Structure. The equipotential bonding grid shall cover the contour of the
pooiﬂand the pool deck extending 3 feet horizontally from the inside walls of the
pool. The equipotential bonding grid shall be arranged in a 12 inch by 12 inch
network of conductors in a uniformly spaced perpendicular grid pattern with
tolerance of 4 inches.
(c.) Securmg The below-grade grid shall be secured within or under the pool and

deck
{NEW) 700.
(NEW) (Am

equipment,
equipment i

Exce:
in 7C

(NEW) 701

(NEW) (Amgg

the meter

indicating ty|
Exception: A sign shall not be required for individual unit equipment as specified

01.11(G).

in7
(NEW) 702

(NEW) (Am
the meter

media.
3 Signs.

d) (A) Emergency sources. A sign shall be placed at the service entrance
at the meter location, and on any equipment up to the service entrance
wlicating type and location of on-site emergency power sources.

ption: A sign shall not be required for individual unit equipment as specified
0.12(F).

9 Signs.

d) (A) Mandated standby. A sign shall be placed at the service entrance, at
ocation, and on any equipment up to the service entrance equipment
pe and location of on-site legally required standby power sources.

f

8 Signs.
1
H) (A) Standby. A sign shall be placed at the service-entrance equipment, at
location, and on any equipment up to the service entrance equipment




4-39 A REV. 1/77
STATE OF CONNECTICUT Page 54 of 55 pages

REGULATION

of

NAME OF AGENCY
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY

Concerning
SUBJECT MATTER OF REGULATIONS

STATE BUILDING CODE-2005 CONNECTICUT
SUPPLEMENT - 2009 AMENDMENT

Endicatin:g ty%e and location of on-site optional standby power sources. A sign shall not
be required for individual unit equipment for standby illumination.

i
i

STATEMEBE\!T OF PURPOSE: To comply with Public Act 06-162 requiring
revision of the State Building Code to include certain provisions for Floor
Proximity [Egress Path Marking Devices; to correct certain technical
inconsistencies in the currently adopted version of the regulation; to
provide add:tiona! revisions to the regulation to update the State Building
Code to be consistent with new technology; and to make the code more

user-friendly.




CERTIFICATION
R-39 REV. 1777 :

Be it known that the foregoing:

Regulations
Are:

] Adopted

By the aforesaid agenc

Section 29—25? of th
[J Section éf the
. [} Public Act. Noé

" After publication m the

[] Adopt

(If applicabie):

'l:l Al
WHEREFORE, the fore

pursuant to:

2 General Statutes.

| of the Public Acts.

B4 Amend

X Amended as hereinabove stated

General Statutes, as amended by Public Act No.

[ Repeal

gosng regulations are hereby:

Page 55 of 55 pages

[} Emergency Regulations

{"] Repealed

ofthe  Public Acts.

[:3onnec:ticut Law Journal on January 29, 2008, of the notice of the proposal to:

such regulations

d the holding of an advertised public hearing on 26" day of February , 2008

i ] Adopted X Aﬁended as hereinabove stated [] Repealed
Effective: ‘ _
[ When filed with the éSecreiary of State.

(OR)

The 1st day of Augt

st, 2009

In Withess Wheréof: -

DATE
3/’3/§?
/

SIGNER (

ad of Board, Agency or Commission} OFFiCIAL TITLE, DULY AUTHORIZED

Commissioner

(

OFFICIAL TITLE, DULY AUTHORIZED

ASEQC, MYV oEN

3/]‘?/0‘7

' \ S ‘
Approved by thaAAttornjey Gerg;ral as to legal sufficiency / /6 /l / k
in accordance with Sec. 4-169° as amended, C.G.S.

' /f /{ /

: é ,

[} Approved

[] Disapproved -

(] Disapproved m part

[ Rejected wEthdut pré.,_judice.

(Indicate Section Numbers disapproved only)

By the Legislative Regilation
with Sec. 4-170, as amgnded

of the General Siatutes.

Review Commitiee in accordance

DATE SIGNED (Clerk of the Legislative Regulation Review Commitlee)

Two certified coples received

amended, of the General Stall

Ltes.

and filed, and one such copy forwarded to the Gommission on Official Legal Publications in accordance with Section 4.172, as

DATE

SIGNED (Secretary of the Siate}

BY

INSTRUCTIONS

One copy of all regulg
Attorney General for hE<s'

Seventeen coptes of

tions for adoption, amendment or repeal, except emergency regulations, must be presented to the
determination of legal sufficiency. Section 4-169 of the General Statutes.

:i” regulations for adoption, amendment or repeal, must be presented to the standing Legisiative

Regulation Review Comm(ttee for its approval. Seclion 4-170 of the General Statutes.

'%

Each reguiation must be in the form intended for publication and must include the appropriate regulation section number and
section heading. _Sectéc_in 4-172 of the General Statutes.

Indicate by “(NEWY” in

deleted language in bra

CERT.DOT

feadmg if new regulation. Amended regulations must contain new language in capital letters and
ckets. Section 4-170 of the General Statutes.



